Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #111-17 Recap
Award is in bold

#01

#02

#03

#04

#05

#06

#07

#08

#09

#10

#11

#12

#13

#14

Tennant F14 Orbital Floor Machine
Tennant Top Weight kit

Proteam Provac FS6 Backpack Vacuum
Rubbermaid Janitorial Cleaning Cart
Advance SC500 Disc Floor Scrubber

NSS M1 Pig Vacuum

NSS Dry Pick-Up Carpet & Dusting Kit
Advance ES400 XLP Carpet Extractor
Proteam Proforce 1200XP Vacuum
Proteam Proforce 1500XP Vacuum
Proteam Super Quartervac Backpack Vacuum
Proteam Super Coach Backpack Vacuum
Nobles V-WD-155 Wet/Dry Vacuum

Advance SC400B Floor Scrubber

Fastenal

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$499.99
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Grainger

$2410.96 Alt
$292.92
$468.19
$254.60 Alt
$5345.20 Alt
No Bid

No Bid
$2357.60 Alt
$375.51 Alt
$413.54 Alt
$459.17 Alt
$452.13
612.71 Alt

$1932.70 Alt

Veritiv
$1950.00 Alt
No Bid
$345.00
$350.00
$5195.00 Alt
No Bid

No Bid
$2295.00 Alt
$285.00
$350.00
$325.00 Alt
$325.00
$510.00 Alt

$3250.00 Alt

Waxie
$2459.45 Alt
$120.14 Alt
$352.58
$336.68
$5,880.46
$1,246.18
$302.58
$3,064.89
$297.79
$367.34
$361.69
$341.68
$650.16 Alt

$4,145.37

WCP Frontier Paper

$2,187.81
$268.61 No Award
$349.43
No Bid
$6,809.54
No Bid
No Bid
$5,737.94
$311.60 No Award
No Bid

$339.29

$339.75

$699.76

$4,561.00



Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #111-17 Recap
Award is in bold

#16

#17

#18

#19

#20

#21

#22

#23

Advance VL500 35 Wet/Dry Vacuum
Proteam Progen 15 Upright Vacuum
Proteam Supercoach Backpack Vacuum
Nobles EX-Spot 2 Portable Spot Extractor
Tennant T5 Floor Scrubber

NSS Alpha 24 Wet/Dry Vacuuum

Global GE1001 Backpack Vacuum

Oreck XL Commercial Upright Vacuum

Fastenal

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Grainger

$412.65 Alt
$413.54
$450.72

$1,054.79

$11,087.81 Alt

No Bid
$450.72 Alt

$235.90

Veritiv
$250.00 Alt
$325.00
$325.00
$360.00 Alt
$9400.00 Alt
No Bid
$300.00 Alt

No Bid

Waxie
$266.61
$331.11
$350.80
$342.25 Alt
$8402.13 Alt
$618.64 Alt
$341.68 Alt

No Bid

WCP Frontier Paper

$348.62
$380.47
No Bid
$663.70
$10,075.87
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



