
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

RFP #108-17: E-Rate Eligible Equipment, Telecommunications, and Internet Services

Bid Re-Cap, 2/3/2017

Service ACS GCI

Internet 34,944.00$ 46,800.00$ 

Voice - Local 2,324.40$   2,537.31$   

Voice - PRI/SIP 3,163.35$   No Bid

Voice - Long Distance $0.07 / min No Bid

Data (Lit Service) - Nikiski High 690.00$      No Bid

Data (Lit Service) - K-Beach 690.00$      No Bid

Data (Lit Service) - Nikiski North Star 690.00$      No Bid

Data (Lit Service) - Sterling Elementary 690.00$      No Bid

Data (Lit Service) - Hope 2,864.00$   No Bid

Data (Lit Service) - Susan B. English 1,660.00$   No Bid

Data (Lit Service) - Kenai Alternative 3,362.00$   864.00$      

Data (Lit Service) - Paul Banks 5,354.00$   864.00$      

Data (Lit Service) - Homer Flex 3,716.00$   864.00$      

Data (Lit Service) - Marathon 275.00$      240.00$      

Data (Lit Service) - Tebughna No Award No Award

Data (Lit Service) - Seward Middle 5,116.00$   8,864.00$   

Equipment ACS ACS (Alt) GCI PCMG Structured Questivity Vibes

Equipment - Switches 72,725.76$ **** 46,339.08$ 42,384.84$ *** 43,173.00$ 60,480.00$ 

Equipment - Routers 17,086.89$ **** 14,271.50$ 10,666.17$ 8311.11** 12,250.00$ 15,445.00$ 

Equipment - UPS 1500 62,261.84$ 69,058.28$ 52,775.36$ 50,335.88$ No Bid No Bid

Equipment - UPS Monitoring Cards 31,130.92$ 52,623.40$ 24,543.28$ 28,156.68$ No Bid No Bid

** Alternate

*** Evaluation committee determined equipment proposed did not meet RFP specifications

**** Evaluation committee unable to compare. Insufficient information (no part numbers supplied in proposal)

Red cell indicates bid award


