Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #113-17 Recap
Award is in bold
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SHURE #ULXS124/85 - J1 WIRELESS COMBO MICROPHONE SYSTEM

SHURE #SM58LC CARDIOID DYNAMIC VOCAL MICROPHONE

SHURE #PGA48-LC CARDIOID DYNAMIC VOCAL MICROPHONE

AUDIX #CBLM25 MINI XLR CABLES 25'

STAGE LIGHTING STORE #Black Safety Cable - 30"

TECHNOMAD #1533 UNIVERSAL WALLMOUNT BRACKET

TECHNOMAD #1538 SMALL POLE-MOUNT ADAPTOR

TECHNOMAD #594 REPLACEMENT NETWORK FOR BERLIN LOUDSPEAKER

MACKIE #PPM608 POWER MIXER

RADIAL ENGINEERING PROAV2 MULTIMEDIA DI #R800 1112 DIRECT BOX, STEREO DI

RADIAL ENGINEERING TRIM-TWO #R800 1117 00 DIRECT BOX, PASSIVE STEREO DI

GUARDIAN FALL PROTECTION #11171 SERAPH CONSTRUCTION FULL BODY HARNESS

GUARDIAN FALL PROTECTION #11200 INTERNAL SHOCK LANYARD

LSE LIGHTING #LSE-MSD5R BULBS

SUNCO LIGHTING #BR-40 FLOOD LIGHT BULBS

PRO CO #SMA1204FBX-200 AUDIO SNAKE

SOURCE FOUR EDLT #426EDLT LENS TUBES

ELECTRO-VOICE EKX-15 #F.01U.303.365 2-WAY PASSIVE LOUDSPEAKER

CROWN #XLS2002 POWER AMPLIFIER

PATHWAY #1004 DEMULTIPLEXER

ETC ELEMENT #4330A1122 CONTOL CONSOLE

AVES

$815.97

$82.84

$24.90

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$683.75

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$763.40

NO BID

$638.92

$425.81

NO BID

NO BID

B&H Photo

$840.00
$90.00
$25.00
$18.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$529.00
$99.00
$109.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$239.00
$469.00
$349.00
NO BID

$5,329.00

BMI Cascio
Supply Inc.
$989.00 $797.90
$110.00 $93.90
$40.00 $39.90
$30.00 NO BID
$530.00 Alt NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$910.00 $615.90
$155.00 $112.90
$195.00 $131.90
$115.00 Alt NO BID
$40.00 Alt NO BID
$175.00 Alt NO BID
$180.00 NO BID
$650.00 $387.90 Alt
$210.00 NO BID
$665.00 NO BID
$525.00 $447.90
$500.00 NO BID

$4,800.00

NO BID

Full Compass
Systems

$885.09
$91.20
$26.57
$16.63
$1100.00 Alt
$228.89
$60.52
$232.64
$604.49
$135.30
$125.13
NO BID
NO BID
$176.40 Alt

NO BID
$624.11
$202.81
$489.82
$421.92
$428.07

$4,845.60

Guitar
Center

$741.92
$82.00
$23.00
$16.00
$630.00 Alt
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$534.00
$135.00
$114.00
NO BID
NO BID
$155.29 Alt
NO BID
$634.99
$226.50
$494.14
302.44
$434.30

$5,311.00

Howard

Tech Sol.

$952.00

$130.00

$50.00

$35.00

$1,639.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$644.00

NO BID

NO BID

Professional
Procurement
Consultants
$950.00
$102.60
$38.00
$26.00 Alt
$725.00
$350.00
$147.75
$314.75
$697.99 Alt
$149.99
$175.00
$99.99
$39.00
$90.00
$125.00
$780.00
$298.00
$595.00
$599.99
$520.00

$6,550.00

Sweetwater Valiant
National AV
Supply
$931.27 $828.75
$94.05 $91.80
$26.23 $28.20
$22.95 $21.20 Alt
$865.00 NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$627.71 $594.00
$130.73 Alt NO BID
$106.66 Alt NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
334.67 Alt NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$624.22 NO BID
$489.45 $459.19
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID



