
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Re-Cap Bid #112-17, Furniture * = Does not meet spec requirements

Award in Bold

Arctic Brodart Capital Demco Lakeshore School School Spenard Staples Think 

Office Office Learning Outfitters Specialty Builders Office

KI INTELLECT WAVE #EC12 Student Chair No Bid No Bid 112.26$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 100.26$      No Bid No Bid 99.00$    

 

KI INTELLECT WAVE #EC14, Student Chair No Bid No Bid 113.78$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 101.86$      No Bid No Bid 99.00$    

 

KI INTELLECT WAVE #EC16 Student Chair No Bid No Bid 115.91$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 105.64$      No Bid No Bid 100.00$  

 

ROYAL SEATING 1100 Series Student Chair $32.00 Alt No Bid 57.41$        No Bid $39.54 Alt No Bid 30.88$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

(School Specialty #1458244)  

VIRCO ZUMA ROCKER #ZROCK13 Student Chair 89.00$        No Bid 116.25$      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

VIRCO ZUMA ROCKER #ZROCK15 Student Chair 94.00$        No Bid 120.56$      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

VIRCO ZUMA ROCKER #ZROCK18 Student Chair 108.00$     No Bid 134.86$      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

VIRCO ZUMA STACK #ZU413 Student Chair 63.00$        No Bid 80.13$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ULINE #H-2506 Drafting Stool 68.00$        No Bid 66.24$        No Bid No Bid $70.00 Alt $50.11 Alt 55.32$        66.00$        No Bid

SAFCO METRO EXTENDED-HEIGHT 3442BL Drafting Stool 257.00$      387.40$      203.53$     No Bid No Bid 310.00$  213.04$      No Bid 232.00$      No Bid

CHILDREN'S FACTORY Cube Chair 52.00$        No Bid 82.02$        No Bid $225.43 Alt No Bid 52.09$        No Bid 85.00$        No Bid

(School Specialty #1428008)

NATIONAL PUBLIC SEATING Stack Chair $67.00 Alt 230.19$      70.24$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 74.20$        118.00$      60.00$        No Bid

(Grainger #49VR91)

School Fix Comfort Stack #ELT18BLACK Stack Chair $38.00 Alt No Bid 51.54$        No Bid No Bid $60.00 Alt $64.17 Alt 66.67$        No Bid No Bid

NPS 800 Series Folding Chair $31.00 Alt No Bid 43.44$        No Bid No Bid 39.00$     37.57$        38.00$        30.00$        No Bid

EUROTECH SEATING Apollo  #DFT9800 Office Stool w/Arms 230.00$     No Bid 339.63$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 285.23$      No Bid 237.00$      No Bid

OFM #405-VAM Guest / Reception Chair 158.00$      266.07$      126.49$     No Bid No Bid $205.00 Alt 168.22$      168.00$      128.00$      No Bid

OFM #403-VAM-605 Guest / Reception Chair 161.00$      305.77$      135.96$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 248.30$      188.00$      140.00$      No Bid

GRESSCO "Relax" Rectangle Sofa w/Back No Bid No Bid 1,760.18$  2,056.00$  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,380.00$  No Bid

(Demco #WF13631600)



SMITH SYSTEM UXL NEST & FOLD #NL3060 Folding Table, Rectangle 800.00$     999.43$      639.53 Alt * No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,067.34$  No Bid No Bid No Bid

SMITH SYSTEM UXL NEST & FOLD #FL2448 Folding Table, Rectangle 561.00$     672.47$      443.48 Alt * No Bid No Bid No Bid 860.91$      No Bid No Bid No Bid

SOUTHERN ALUMINUM LINENLESS SWIRL #SA1860PL-SS Folding Table 354.00$      No Bid 333.47$      No Bid No Bid 335.00$  No Bid 335.00$      305.00$     No Bid

 Rectangle

Classroom Select LockEdge #1362571 Activity Table, Rectangle 290.00$      No Bid 257.41$      No Bid $224.87 Alt No Bid 209.71$     No Bid No Bid No Bid

30" W  x  60" L  x  15-24" H  

Classroom Select LockEdge #1362571 Activity Table, Rectangle 290.00$      No Bid 248.94$      No Bid $258.77 Alt No Bid 209.71$     No Bid No Bid No Bid

24" W  x  72" L  x  15-24" H  

Classroom Select LockEdge #1362587 Activity Table, Horseshoe 476.00$      No Bid 630.32$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 345.78$     No Bid No Bid No Bid

VIRCO 4000 Series #483060 Activity Table 165.00$      No Bid 134.32$     No Bid $224.87 Alt No Bid 209.71$      No Bid No Bid No Bid

Classroom Select "Clover" #1362585 Activity Table, Adjustable 269.00$      No Bid 313.65$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 195.91$     No Bid No Bid No Bid

School Fix #BFR3072 Activity Table, Rectangle $175.00 Alt No Bid 315.67$      No Bid No Bid No Bid $264.97 Alt 326.17$      No Bid No Bid

School Fix #BFH6066 Activity Table, Horseshoe $305.00 Alt No Bid 496.06$      No Bid $394.37 Alt No Bid $398.54 Alt 571.60$      No Bid No Bid

School Fix #BFRD42 Activity Table, Round $174.00 Alt No Bid 259.92$      No Bid $258.77 Alt No Bid $215.66 Alt 291.79$      No Bid No Bid

NORWOOD COMMERCIAL FURNITURE #RCE2448C Activity Table $146.00 Alt No Bid 221.08$      No Bid $202.27 Alt 230.00$  $167.91 Alt 194.00$      No Bid No Bid

 Rectangle

ECR4KIDS #ECR-14107 Activity Table, Rectangle No Bid No Bid 174.26$      No Bid $202.27 Alt No Bid $171.29 Alt No Bid 199.00$      No Bid

ACADEMIA #4872ADJ, Activity Table, Kidney Shaped $335.00 Alt No Bid 529.87$      No Bid $360.47 Alt No Bid $342.10 Alt No Bid No Bid No Bid

NORWOOD COMMERCIAL FURNITURE #RCEHRC, Activity Table $283.00 Alt No Bid 316.61$      No Bid $303.97 alt 380.00$  No Bid 377.00$      No Bid No Bid

Half Moon Shape

KI UNIFRAME Model UCB8 Convertible Bench Table $695.00 Alt No Bid 487.48$     No Bid No Bid $910.00 Alt $623.55 Alt $850.00 Alt No Bid 516.00$  

MITCHELL  GP SERIES #GP-12/16 Cafeteria Table $1450.00 Alt No Bid 3,058.82$  No Bid No Bid $2150.00 Alt $1786.24 Alt 2,120.00$  1,609.00$  No Bid

VIRCO #MTB152712 Cafeteria Table 1,461.00$  No Bid 1,850.76$  No Bid No Bid $1725.00 Alt $1440.45 Alt $1735.00 Alt No Bid No Bid

SCHOLAR CRAFT 2800 Series #2800-SPBK Student Desk, Lift Lid $136.00 Alt No Bid $153.22 Alt No Bid No Bid No Bid $181.53 Alt $173.00 Alt No Bid No Bid

Classroom Select Traditional Student Desk, Open Front $86.00 Alt No Bid 135.80$      No Bid No Bid $130.00 Alt 90.93$        No Bid 129.00$      No Bid

(School Specialty #1426982)

 



KI IVY LEAGUE 20 Series #IL20R.A Student Desk, Open Front $109.00 Alt No Bid 161.41$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 167.45$      No Bid No Bid 140.00$  

 

VIRCO 3400BRL Student Desk with Chair Combo 152.00$     No Bid 212.88$      No Bid No Bid No Bid $170.66 Alt No Bid No Bid No Bid

SAFECO ALPHABETTER 1201BE Student Desk, Stand Up 246.00$      445.14$      241.29$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 256.94$      No Bid 239.00$     No Bid

DIVERSIFIED WOOD PRODUCTS "LEARNITURE" #LNT-DEI1011-54-SO $457.00 Alt No Bid 454.13$      No Bid No Bid $369.00 Alt 363.66$     No Bid No Bid No Bid

Science Lab Table w/Chemical Resistant Top

VIVO CART-V02D Stand-up Desk/Presentation Cart/Computer No Bid No Bid 141.16$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Workstation

OFFICEFURNITURE.COM #OFG-CT0056 Conference Table No Bid No Bid 929.18$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALLIED MARKERBOARD IMAGINATION STATION Dry Erase Table No Bid No Bid 605.56$      No Bid No Bid No Bid $306.52 Alt 328.72$      No Bid No Bid

Kidney Shape (Nasco #Z48006M)

 

HON 10500 Series #H105816L, Desk Extended Corner Unit 575.00$      No Bid 657.50$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 598.01$      No Bid 516.00$     No Bid

HON 10500 Series #H10561, Desk Return Shell 272.00$      No Bid 317.25$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 287.93$      No Bid 251.00$     No Bid

HON 10500 Series #H10534G, Desk Stack-on Overhead 860.00$      No Bid 929.38$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 732.23$     No Bid 798.00$      No Bid

HON 10500 Series #H105856, Desk Back Enclosure for Stack-on Unit 121.00$      No Bid 119.89$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 124.17$      No Bid 113.00$     No Bid

HON 10500 Series #H90056, Desk Tackboard 128.00$      No Bid 148.50$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 118.92$     No Bid 143.00$      No Bid

HON 10500 Series #H105102, Mobile Pedestal 445.00$      No Bid 500.38$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 450.90$      No Bid 410.00$     No Bid

HON 10500 Series #H105104, Mobile Pedestal 445.00$      No Bid 500.38$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 450.90$      No Bid 410.00$     No Bid

HON 38000 Series #HON38291RNS Pedestal Desk, Right 756.00$      No Bid 853.38$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 763.41$      No Bid 722.00$     No Bid

CLASSROOM SELECT CONTEMPORARY SERIES Desk Triangle Collaboration $183.00 Alt No Bid 142.82$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 113.69$     No Bid No Bid No Bid

ERGOTRON WorkFit-T #33-397-085 Sit-Stand Desktop Workstation 549.00$      No Bid 315.29 Alt * No Bid No Bid No Bid $523.97 Alt 500.00$     No Bid No Bid

ERGOTRON WorkFit-T #33-394-200 Sit-Stand Desktop Workstation $549.00 Alt No Bid 451.41 Alt * No Bid No Bid No Bid $370.74 Alt $695.0 Alt No Bid No Bid

LORELL #LLR81974 Sit-Stand Desktop Workstation No Bid No Bid 173.94$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 252.22$      No Bid No Bid No Bid

ERGOTRON WithinReach Lift-n-Lock 5000 Swivel Keyboard Tray $226.00 Alt No Bid 194.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid $219.11 Alt No Bid No Bid No Bid

WORKRITE ERGONOMICS CONFORM ARTICULATING Monitor Arm, Single $170.00 Alt No Bid 158.27$      No Bid No Bid No Bid $244.33 Alt No Bid 110.00$     No Bid

BALT INSTRUCTOR TEACHERS DESK II #90591 Teacher's Desk 1,133.00$  1,725.98$  882.54$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 705.83$      No Bid 533.00$     No Bid



STAND UP DESK #SUDC48FT-BK/GB Desk, Height Adjustable No Bid No Bid 484.81$     No Bid No Bid No Bid $577.78 Alt No Bid No Bid No Bid

CHILD CRAFT #1301428 Bench Coat Locker No Bid No Bid 250.00$      No Bid $450.87 Alt $450.00 Alt 243.14$     No Bid 301.00$      No Bid

HON 10700 Series #10762J File Cabinet, Lateral, 2-drawer 584.00$      No Bid 1,097.50$  No Bid No Bid No Bid 606.83$      No Bid 529.00$     No Bid

MAYLINE OFFICE FURNITURE ABERDEEN COLLECTION #AFF26 351.00$      No Bid 366.24$      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 329.00$     No Bid

File Cabinet, Vertical, 2-drawer

FIREKING Model #41825CPA, Fire Cabinet, Fire Resistant, 2-drawer 1,350.00$  No Bid 2,115.76$  No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,156.04$  No Bid 1,298.00$  No Bid

JUSTRITE CAB80 Safety Cabinet, Combustibles No Bid No Bid 1,363.91$  No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,234.38$  No Bid No Bid No Bid

SANDUSKY LEE Mobile Transport Series Storage Cabinet, Mobile 515.00$     1,240.59$  790.83$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,472.55$  No Bid 690.00$      No Bid

STEVENS INDUSTRIES #80609 E67 Wardrobe Storage Cabinet 2,078.00$  No Bid 2,383.88$  No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,770.69$  No Bid 1,267.00$  No Bid

w/ File Drawer, Mobile

SPROGS #2124A Bookcase, Five Shelves No Bid No Bid 406.48$      No Bid No Bid 340.00$  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BUSH BUSINESS FURNITURE #BK3036AC Bookcase, Two Shelves 165.00$      No Bid 117.58$     No Bid $224.87 Alt No Bid No Bid No Bid 127.00$      No Bid

HON Steel Collection Bookcase, Five Shelves 273.00$      No Bid 859.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 270.24$      No Bid 228.00$     No Bid

DEMCO LIBRARYQUIET #WT12187000 Booktruck $225.00 Alt No Bid 393.91$      438.00$      No Bid No Bid $613.57 Alt No Bid 399.00$      No Bid

LAYFLAT TABLE MOVER  (School Fix #TT490) Table Cart $380.00 Alt No Bid 303.67$      No Bid No Bid No Bid $243.63 Alt 385.40$      No Bid No Bid

LAYFLAT TABLE MOVER  (School Fix #TT499) Table Cart $430.00 Alt No Bid 335.82$     No Bid No Bid No Bid $282.46 Alt * 406.19$      No Bid No Bid

Convertible Bench / Workstation / Cafeteria Table $695.00 Alt No Bid 612.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

NEUTRAL POSTURE XSM Collection Chair, Petite w/Footrest 885.00$      No Bid 739.06$      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 709.00$     No Bid

BEST-RITE 202AG Porcelain Steel Whiteboard w/Deluxe Aluminum Trim $345.00 Alt 980.62$      450.14$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 386.00$      412.00$      No Bid No Bid

IRONWOOD GLACIER LIBRARY SERIES #LS60SBAA Starter No Bid No Bid 738.06$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 599.14$     No Bid No Bid No Bid

Library Stack, Single Face, Starter

IRONWOOD GLACIER LIBRARY SERIES #LS60SAAA Adder No Bid No Bid 654.18$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 573.12$     No Bid No Bid No Bid

Library Stack, Single Face, Adder

IRONWOOD GLACIER LIBRARY SERIES #LS60SBAA Custom Adder No Bid No Bid 654.18$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 587.46$     No Bid No Bid No Bid

Library Stack, Single Face, Custom Adder w/Filler

 

STEVENS INDUSTRIES L-SHAPED #SO440 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,500.00$  No Bid

Circulation Desk w/Enclosed Storage  



PREMIER CRISS CROSS Stools, Café Height No Bid No Bid 271.44$      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 200.00$     No Bid

 (Demco #13623950)

PREMIER Table, Café Height No Bid No Bid 435.79$      468.00$      No Bid No Bid $321.85 Alt No Bid 420.00$      No Bid

(Demco #14978210)

NATIONAL PUBLIC SEATING 8600 SERIES SIGNATURE $50.00 Alt 174.04$      99.08$        No Bid No Bid 74.00$     59.66$        82.00$        54.00$        No Bid

Stack Chair, Lightweight

ATS QS Model QAS-42-FLR30 #QAS-42-ARM-120-M No Bid No Bid 567.89$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 625.00$      No Bid No Bid

Booth, Single

ATS QS Model QAD-42-FLR30 #QAS-42-ARM-120-M No Bid No Bid 828.01$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,000.00$  No Bid No Bid

Booth, Double

HON BASYX HVL210 Task Chair w/ No Arms 120.00$      No Bid 126.13$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 113.77$      No Bid 103.00$     No Bid


