
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Bid #116-17 Re-Cap

Award in Bold

* = Alternate

** = Does not meets specs Builder's Fastenal Home SBS Kenai

Choice Depot

PAINT, EXTERIOR No Bid No Bid $123.00 $125.00*

BEHR PREMIUM PLUS #720E-2 

PAINT, EXTERIOR No Bid No Bid $27.48 $26.00*

BEHR PREMIUM PLUS ULTRA #PPU-18-6 

PAINT BRUSH No Bid No Bid $18.66 No Bid

HOME DEPOT #HD A 1172 4 

PAINT BRUSH No Bid No Bid $15.87 No Bid

HOME DEPOT #A 1827 3 

ROLLER FRAME No Bid $1.625* $4.47 $2.50*

LINZER #RF 211-9 

ROLLER TRAY No Bid No Bid $4.68 $1.69*

WOOSTER # 0BR5690110 

TRAY LINERS No Bid No Bid $0.98 */** $5.90*

PROJECT SELECT #RM 4110 

ROLLER COVERS No Bid $2.24* $10.75 $6.28*

GOOD #2001675 

EXTENSION CORD No Bid $82.05* $60.97* $55.29*

RIDGID # 757-123050RL6A 



MECHANICS TOOL SET (268-Piece) No Bid No Bid $199.00 No Bid

HUSKY #H268MTS 

FRACTIONAL DIAL CALIPER No Award No Bid $29.99 $26.37* No Bid

GENERAL #142 

IMPACT DRIVER No Bid $211.66* $199.00 $195.00

DEWALT #DCF887D2 

BUILDING WIRE No Bid No Bid $262.00* $57.00/250'

ROMEX #28828201 

ROOFING PANELS, RIBBED; 36” W x 12’L $42.60 * No Bid $37.17 $40.20

METAL SALES PRO-PANEL II #HD2594112 

ROOFING PANELS, RIBBED; 37.75” W x 8’ L 32.64* No Bid $3.60/LF* No Bid

FABRAL SHELTERGUARD #0410115176 

ROOFING PANELS, PLASTIC No Bid No Bid $23.51 $35.00

SUNTUF #101699 

CARRIAGE BOLTS No Bid $0.574* $17.51 No Bid

EVERBILT #804440 

HEX NUTS No Bid $4.28* $10.91 No Bid

EVERBILT #804870 

FLAT WASHER No Bid $3.23* $7.49 No Bid

EVERBILT #804910 

SCREW, WOOD DECK $22.73* $.039* $34.48 $37.39*

DECK MATE #735068 



SCREW, COMBO MACHINE No Bid $1.24* $1.18/6* No Bid

THE HILLMAN GROUP #90123 

NYLON INSERT LOCK NUT No Bid $3.39* $3.97* No Bid

THE HILLMAN GROUP #180132 

HASP, SAFETY No Bid $3.99 $6.97* $5.75

NATIONAL #N102-459 

GALVANIZED BOX NAILS No Bid $4.99* $4.98* $2.75

TREE ISLAND #NLS16GB 

GALVANIZED COMMON NAILS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

TREE ISLAND #NLS60GC 

GALVANIZED BOX NAILS No Bid No Bid $4.98* $2.75

TREE ISLAND #NLS6GBS 

GALVANIZED BOX NAILS No Bid $3.01* $4.98* $2.75

TREE ISLAND #NLS12GB 

GALVANIZED ROOFING NAILS No Bid $2.27* $3.43* $2.50

TREE ISLAND #NLS114GR 

STEEL WOOD SCREW No Bid $7.80* $0.06* No Bid

FABRAL #6789060875 

T-HINGE No Bid $8.14 $6.98* $4.25

NATIONAL #N129-171 

BARREL BOLT No Bid $15.89 $11.48* $7.00

NATIONAL #N162-388 



GABLE MOUNT AUTOMATIC SHUTTER No Bid No Bid $44.36 $37.00

MASTER FLOW #SGM20 

GABLE MOUNT ATTIC POWER FAN No Bid No Bid $108.33 $110.00

MASTER FLOW #EGV6 

STEEL DOOR $225.00 * No Bid $153.16 $225.00

JELD-WEN #THDJW166100278 

INSULATION, KRAFT FACED – R13 No Bid No Bid $15.93 $20.46*

OWENS CORNING #RF10 

DRIP EDGE No Bid No Bid $4.72* $4.67

ACS BUILDING PRODUCTS (SBS #2113138) 

ASPHALT SHINGLES $37.11* No Bid $30.00* $40.00

MALARKEY - SBS #RFSMSBSARMBD 

TUBE PIPE INSULATION KIT No Bid No Bid $1.36 $1.25

M-D BUILDING PRODUCTS #50150 

SAND PAPER, ASSORTED No Bid No Bid $7.97 2.50$          

3M #9005NA 

PIER BLOCKS $7.61 No Bid $6.58 $6.25

SPENARD BUILDERS #24900323 

POST BASES FOR PIER BLOCKS $6.82* No Bid $6.25* $7.50

BOISE CASCADE IMPORT 6X6 HDG POST BASES 

(SBS #21300066)

1” x 3” x 12’ Common Pine No Bid No Bid $9.16 $3.83

SPENARD BUILDERS #UKP10312 



1” x 4” x 8’ Whitewood Common $4.19 No Bid $4.20 $3.60

HOME DEPOT #914681 

1” x 4” x 12’ Common Pine $6.28 No Bid $6.29 $5.60

SPENARD BUILDERS #UKP10412 

1” x 4” x 14’ Common Pine $8.38 No Bid No Bid $6.30

SPENARD BUILDERS #UKP10414 

2” x 4” x 8’ Whitewood Stud $3.28 No Bid $2.72 $3.60

HOME DEPOT #161640 

2” x 4” x 8’ Stud $3.28 No Bid No Bid $3.60

SPENARD BUILDERS #SPF20408 

2” x 4” x 10' $4.10 No Bid $5.17 $4.68

SPENARD BUILDERS #SPF20410 

2” x 4” x 12’ $4.92 No Bid $5.95 $5.49

HOME DEPOT #161667 

2” x 4” x12’ $4.92 No Bid No Bid $5.44

SPENARD BUILDERS #SPF20412 

2” x 6” x 10’ $6.15 No Bid $7.54 $7.00

HOME DEPOT #161721 

 2” x 6” x 12’ $7.88 No Bid $9.16 $8.52

HOME DEPOT #161756 

2” x 6” x 8’ DECKING $14.36 No Bid $9.30 $9.20

SUPERIOR WOOD TREATING #ODW20608DD 



2” x 6” x 12’ DECKING $21.54 No Bid $14.23 $13.80

SUPERIOR WOOD TREATING #ODW20612DD 

2” x 4” x 10’ PRESSURE TREATED $8.97 No Bid 6.97 ** $7.17

HOME DEPOT #1001793881 

2” x 6” x 10’ PRESSURE TREATED $12.74 No Bid $10.67 $10.25

HOME DEPOT #1001793922

4” x 6” x 12’ PRESSURE TREATED $15.21 ** No Bid $19.69 $24.60

7/16"  x 4' x 8' OSB $14.89 No Bid $19.05 $14.85

HOME DEPOT #386081, SBS #OSB716 

19/32” x 4’ x 8’ T1-11, 8" OC $46.49 No Bid $30.36 $41.25

PLYTANIUM #113699 

3/8” (11/32) x 4’ x 8’ T1-11 $31.27 No Bid No Bid $35.67

SPENARD BUILDERS #T1113848 

23/32” x 4’ x 8’ SHEATHING PLYWOOD $30.77 No Bid $35.18 $28.75

HOME DEPOT #439614 

¾” x 4’ x 8’ UNDERLAYMENT PLYWOOD $32.51* No Bid $37.78 $37.39

SPENARD BUILDERS #UND34 

DELIVERY CHARGE TO HOMER $50.00 $30.99 No Bid $200.00

DELIVERY CHARGE TO KENAI 0 $30.99 No Bid 0

DELIVERY CHARGE TO SOLDOTNA 0 $30.99 $79.00 0

DELIVERY CHARGE TO VOZNESENKA $100.00 $30.99 No Bid $250.00


