Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Revised Re-Cap #114-17 Welding Equipment and Supplies
Award in bold

Welder, Multiprocess
MILLERMATIC 215 MULTIMATIC #907693

Welder, Multiprocess
MILLERMATIC 215 WITH TIG KIT #951674

Welder, Multiprocess
MILLERMATIC 200 WITH TIG CONTRACTOR KIT #951649

Welder
MILLER SPECTRUM 625 X-TREME #907579

Welder, Multiprocess
MILLERMATIC TIG CONTRACTOR KIT #301-287

Welding & Cutting Outfit
VICTOR CONTENDER #084-2051

Welding Gun
MILLERMATIC SPOOLMATE 150 Spool Gun #301-272

Gun Nozzle, Flush
MILLER Gun Nozzle #169715

Contact Tip, .035
MILLER #000068

Air Liquide

$ 1,317.44

$ 1,644.47

$ 2,162.99

$ 1,658.82

S 374.72

$ 394.52

S 333.70

S 8.82

S 9.30

Alaska Bolt
& Chain

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Alaska Industrial

Hardware

$1,679.94

$ 2,098.80

$ 2,763.05

$2,118.98

S 569.81

$ 529.03

S 387.60

S 15.26

$0.98 ea

Fastenal

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 560.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Matheson

Gas LLC

$ 1,257.97

$ 1,597.27

$ 2,107.77

$ 1,627.47

S 340.67

S 427.77

S 304.97

S 10.56

S 15.80

Midwest

Technology

$ 1,206.90

$ 1,506.50

$1,981.51

$1,519.60

$ 313.50

No Bid

$ 279.18

S 18.00

$9.48/10

Pacific Alaske

Lumber Co.

$ 1,682.17

$ 2,103.92

$ 2,759.92

$2,112.78

S 46131

S 522.82

S 42448

S 22.70

S 15.26



Brazing Nozzle Tip 00-W
WELDINGCITY #00-W with MIXER

Electrode Holder
HOT MAX #22022

Welding Pliers, Mig Multi-Function
HOBART #770150

Stringer Bead Twist Knot Wire Wheel Brush
RADNOR #97707

Tong Electrode Holders
TWECO #358-9110-1101

Electrode Holders
TWECO A316

Welding Rod

LINCOLN ELECTRIC CO EXCALIBUR 7018 MR, AWSE7018-H4R

#ED028281

Welding Rod

LINCOLN ELECTRIC CO EXCALIBUR 7011 MR, AWSE7018-1 H4R

#ED028702

Cutting Tip, Heavy Duty
VICTOR 1-101-1 #670G2411

Plasma Tip
MILLER #249928

Plasma Electrode
MILLER #249926

$ 38.15

§27.95 *
$8.45* /
$8.49 *

S 2795
S 3033
$ 90.00
S 122.00
S 10.55
S 8.73
$ 15.54

No Bid

$10.59 *

$10.59 *

$6.79 *

$16.29 *

$15.99 *

$100.50 *

115.69 *

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

S 48.30
$ 4434
S 2491
S 15.29
$ 4434
S 37.80
S 119.40
S 126.00
S 16.60
S 4.03
$7.20 ea

S 48.99

17.99 *

$14.29 *

$10.89 *

$ 3599

S 39.99

No Bid

No Bid

$ 9.99

No Bid

No Bid

S 4567

10.75 *

$9.25 *

$8.40 * /

$ 2353

S 29.57

$2.27 ea

$2.38 ea

$10.92 *

S 11.39

S 20.29

No Bid

No Bid

$23.50 *

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

s

8.90

15.84

$ 5196
32.734 *
$34.003 *
$15.895 *
S 3377
S  36.55
S 137.17
S 156.40
S 14.78
S 12.03
S 2132



Plasma Drag Shield
MILLER #251960

Plasma Swirl Ring
MILLER #249931

C-Clamp Pliers, Locking
STRONG HAND TOOLS PR6

Mig Welding Pliers
IRWIN VISE-GRIP #1873303

Welding Magnet, Standard
STRONG HAND TOOLS MS45

O-Ring
MILLER PLASMA MAIN BODY #249969

Respirator, Welding
MILLER N95 #267334

Welding Helmet, Auto Darkening
MILLER ELECTRIC #251292

Welding Helmet, Auto Darkening

JACKSON with BLACK HALO-X INSIGHT LENS #46131

Faceshield HeadGear w/Ratchet
FIBRE-METAL ROUGHNECK F400

Faceshield Window
FIBRE-METAL #4178CL

7.82 **

$ 1133

$9.37 *

§23.12 *

$5.01 *

S 4.86

S 29.40

S 78.82

$300.96 *

S 16.87

S 5.11

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$9.99 *

No Bid

No Bid

$23.99 *

$79.99 *

$112.99 *

$11.95 *

$7.49 *

11.56

16.49

20.46

2491

8.42

12.29

39.57

60.19

99.00

19.56

5.91

No Bid

No Bid

$14.32 %

S 2412

$29.99 *

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 198.74

S 24.90

s 7.89

S 10.23

S 14.77
S 12.16
S 25.97
$ 3287
S 6.36
$5.30 ea

S 85.87
S 190.97
$32.98 *

$10.78 *

S 7.80

S 11.56

No Bid

$ 2350

No Bid

S 4.97

$ 30.00

$ 72.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

11.58

15.50

12.42

25.11

18.74

2.73

42.93

101.44

179.49

22.30

7.63



Safety Glasses S 2.67 $1.89 * $1.39* No Bid $1.65 * S 2.51 S 4.26
MILLER CLASSIC #272187

Goggles, Flip Front S 13.54 $10.79 * S 13.99 $ 19.23 12.75 * No Bid S 18.12
JACKSON WS85 #15992
Ear Muff 9.54 * $15.99 * S 2365 S 17.87 S 18.17 No Bid S 18.25

JACKSON VIBE 26 #20774

Ear Plug, Uncorded S 0.56 No Bid S 219.60 S 081 S 0.77 No Bid S 89.56
PISTONZ #P1400
Welding Jacket, Leather S64.54; $63.86 * $67.99 * S  48.25 S 69.45 S 62.77 No Bid S 78.59

TILLMAN #3280

Welding Spats w/Oak Tan Flare $30.33 * No Bid No Bid S 40.57 S 3479 No Bid $ 3455
TILLMAN #527

Welding Gloves $8.55 * $10.19 * S 9.46 S 12.84 S 10.67 No Bid S 10.35
TILLMAN #1080

Welding Gloves, Mig S 8.60 $12.59 * $ 2591 S 13.44 S 9.99 No Bid S 10.95
TILLMAN #1250

Freight All-or None
$7,250.00

All-or-None

* = Alternate
/ = No spec sheets provided, cannot find specs
** = Local Bidders Preference






