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139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669
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RECAP
Bid #141-16

Due Date: 6-3-16

Item #

01 BASE CORNER FILLER
UNIT
     NO DOORS

Ak Education & Rec. Prod.
Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Demco
K-Log
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
Staples

$517.00 ***
$1119.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$724.11
$720.00

Staples $720.00#

29"W x 36"H x 29"D -
Medium Oak with Dark Oak

Size -

Brand FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS
#7110X.C68.XX000

02 BASE DRAWER CABINET Ak Education & Rec. Prod.
Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Demco
K-Log
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
Staples

$1027.00 ***
$1488.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$1447.32
$1450.00

School Specilty $1447.32#

36"W x 36"H x 29"D -
Medium Oak with Dark Oak

Size -

Brand FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS
#7256X.668.XX0X0

03 BASE DRAWER CABINET Ak Education & Rec. Prod.
Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Demco
K-Log
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
Staples

$1074.00 ***
$1627.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$1600.30
$1585.00

Staples $1585.00#

48”W x 36”H x 29”D -
Medium Oak with Dark Oak

Size -

Brand FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS
#7256X.868.XX0X0

04 BASE LATERAL FILE
CABINET

Ak Education & Rec. Prod.
Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Demco
K-Log
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
Staples

$1114.00 ***
$1469.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$1450.95
$1430.00

Staples $1430.00#

30”W x 30”H x 29”D -
Medium Oak with Dark Oak

Size -

Brand FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS
#7245X.008.XX1X0

    * Does Not Meet Specifications ** No Specificiations Provided *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw
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05 BASE SHELF CABINET
     WITH NON-LOCKING
DOORS

Ak Education & Rec. Prod.
Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Demco
K-Log
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
Staples

$698.00 ***
$1092.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$1080.95
$1075.00

Staples $1075.00#

36"w x 36"H x 29"D -
Medium Oak with Dark Oak

Size -

Brand FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS
#7204X.668.XX0XX

06 TEACHER DESK,
FREESTANDING

Ak Education & Rec. Prod.
Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Demco
K-Log
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
Staples

$1142.00 ***
$1548.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$1531.41
$1515.00

Staples $1515.00#

60W x 30”H x 29”D -
Medium Oak with Dark Oak

Size -

Brand FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS
#7910X.908.XX0X0

07 WALL CABINET
     WITH NON-LOCKING
DOORS

Ak Education & Rec. Prod.
Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Demco
K-Log
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
Staples

$382.00 ***
$548.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$543.89
$540.00

Staples $540.00#

36"W x 30"H x 16"D -
Medium Oak with Dark Oak

Size -

Brand FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS
#7604X.606.XX0XX

08 WALL CABINET
     WITH NON-LOCKING
DOORS

Ak Education & Rec. Prod.
Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Demco
K-Log
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
Staples

$399.00 ***
$598.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$599.57
$595.00

Staples $595.00#

48”W x 30”H x 16”D -
Medium Oak with Dark Oak

Size -

Brand FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS
#7604X.806.XX0XX

    * Does Not Meet Specifications ** No Specificiations Provided *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw
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Due Date: 6-3-16

Item #

09 WALL CABINET
     WITHOUT DOORS

Ak Education & Rec. Prod.
Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Demco
K-Log
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
Staples

$255.00 ***
$398.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$382.28
$380.00

Staples $380.00#

36”W x 30”H x 13”D -
Medium Oak with Dark Oak

Size -

Brand FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS
#7600X.603.XX000

10 WALL CORNER CABINET
     WITH NON-LOCKING
DOOR

Ak Education & Rec. Prod.
Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Demco
K-Log
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
Staples

$397.00 ***
$568.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$570.48
$565.00

Staples $565.00#

30”W x 30”H x 30”D -
Medium Oak with Dark Oak

Size -

Brand FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS
#7104X.C06.XX0XX

    * Does Not Meet Specifications ** No Specificiations Provided *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw


