
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Recap Bid #105-18, Paper

Award in Bold

Arctic Office Lakeshore WCP

COPY PAPER 35.57$     No Bid 34.78$     

XEROX VITALITY MUTLIPURPOSE PRINTER #3R2047 

COPY PAPER $44.67 No Bid 54.90$     

XEROX VITALITY PASTEL MULTIPURPOSE #3R11053; Willamette 

HAMMERMILL #103341 #851001CAN

COPY PAPER 44.67$     No Bid 54.90$     

XEROX VITALITY PASTEL MULTIPURPOSE #3R11051 Willamette 

#851001GRN

COPY PAPER 44.67$     No Bid 54.90$     

XEROX VITALITY PASTEL MULTIPURPOSE #3R11050;  Willamette 

HAMMERMILL #103390 #851001BLU

COPY PAPER 44.67$     No Bid 51.49$     

XEROX VITALITY PASTEL MULTIPURPOSE #3R11058 Willamette 

#851001SA

COPY PAPER 44.67$     No Bid 51.49$     

XEROX VITALITY PASTEL MULTIPURPOSE #3R11060; Willamette 

DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE #81205 #851001CH

CONSTRUCTION PAPER 2.12$       2.47$       1.48$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103029; Pacon #103029 Superbright Tru-Ray #103029

PACON PEACOCK Series #P6309 #TA70BK



CONSTRUCTION PAPER 3.93$       4.51$       3.15$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103036; Pacon #103036 Superbright Tru-Ray #103036

PACON PEACOCK Series #P8412 #TA71YE

CONSTRUCTION PAPER 4.42$       4.51$       3.61$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103038; Pacon #103038 Superbright Tru-Ray #103038

PACON PEACOCK Series #P8012 #TA71HG

CONSTRUCTION PAPER 4.32$       4.51$       3.14$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103056; Pacon #103056 Superbright Tru-Ray #103056

PACON PEACOCK Series #P6812 #TA71WB

BUTCHER PAPER 81.91$     No Bid 55.93$     

PACON SPECTRA DUO-FINISH ARTKRAFT #67001 Pacon #67001

BUTCHER PAPER 92.60$     No Bid 66.15$     

PACON SPECTRA DUO-FINISH ARTKRAFT #67081 Pacon #67081

COPY PAPER 48.61$     No Bid 53.80$     

XEROX VITALITY PASTEL MULTIPURPOSE #3R3761;  Willamette 

HAMMERMILL TIDAL MP #162024 #854001

COPY PAPER 38.25$     No Bid 42.15$     

XEROX VITALITY MUTLIPURPOSE PRINTER #3R2051: Willamette

HAMMERMILL #162016 #117001


