BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS

- PRICE PER PRICE PER
F"' QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE FOB CASE FOB
= SOLDOTNA ANCHORAGE
#
Beef, COUntry Fried Steak Finger, Breaded. FU”y Cooked Beef AdvancePierre #68016 FSA S 81.79 s 80.51
Steak. This product must be CN labeled. Four Fingers must
200 50 CASE | 5001970z |Provide 20z M/MA and 10z equivalent grains for Child Nutrition ~ |OF approved equal
Meal Pattern Requirements.
LaS?gTa ?heelts, Pre g;olkid,l WG. Product must prOVide 1oz Marzetti #41308-31025 FSA No Bid No Bid
equivalent grains per CN label.
201 0 | CASE | 48/50z or approved equal
Fully Cooked Rib Shaped Pork Patty With Honey BBQ Sauce. AdvancePierre #3817 FSA $ 50.66 | $ 49.79
Product must be CN labeled. Each serving must provide 20z
202| 50 | CASE | 10032507 [MMA. or approved equal
Ultra Bread Slice, Banana Bread, IW, 51% Whole Grain, Dairy Super Bakery #6071 FSA $ 42673 42.03
Free, Peanut Free. Must conform to USDA Child Nutrition
Program Specifications. Product must provide 20z Grain or approved equal
203 40 CASE | 70/3.4 0z |Equivalent
Chicken Nugget, Whole Grain Breaded Fully Cooked CN Labeled Pilgrim's Pride/Gold Kist #612100
Chicken Nuggets with ISP. No other types of TVP permitted.
Nuggets to be batter breaded with whole grain style breader. CN [TyS0n #70364-928
204 40 CASE 6/5% label to provide 20z M/MA and 10z grain equivalent. Product to  |or approved equal
provide zero grams trans fat.
Advance #68209 FSA | S 69.74 | $ 68.43
- PRICE PER PRICE PER
|T|'|| QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE FOB CASE FOB
= SOLDOTNA ANCHORAGE
#*
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Taquitos, Chicken, Bulk Pack. Product must provide 1/2 0z MIMA |\vindsor/Posada #6580011 FSA | No Bid No Bid
and 10z equivalent grains. g |
or approved equa
205| 0 | CASE |1401.740z pprorece
Chicken Breast Patty, Whole Grain Breaded, Fully Cooked. Tyson #70302-928 FsA | § 100.66 | $ 99.32
Patties to be batter breaded with whole grain crumb style
breader. CN label to provide 2 0z M/MA and 1 oz equivalent or approved equal
206 25 CASE | 132/3.75 oz |grains.
Chicken Breast Patty, Breaded, Whole Grain, Fully Cooked. Tyson #2154-928 FsA | $ 6283 |$ 61.50
Product must be CN labeled. One patty must provide 20z M/MA
and 10z equivalent grains per CN label. or approved equal
207 25 CASE | 150/3.290z
Whole Grain Maple Glazed French Toast Sticks, Fully Cooked.  [ichael Foods #46025-75010-00FSA $ 35.00 | § 34.38
Each 2.9 oz serving to provide 1 0oz M/MA and 1 oz equivalent
grains. Product must provide CN label. or approved equal
208 100 CASE | 85/290z
Benefit Bar, Cocoa Chip, Breakfast Bar. Each 2.5 oz breakfast |8 j Snackfoods #40406 FSA | $ 2484 |$ 24.48
bar must provide 2 oz equivalent grains per serving
or approved equal
209 60 CASE | 48/250z
- PRICE PER PRICE PER
H QTyY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE FOB CASE FOB
= SOLDOTNA ANCHORAGE
3
Benefit Bar, French Toast, Breakfast Bar. Each 2.5 oz breakfast | g j Snackfoods #40404 FsA | § 23811($ 23.45
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Ddl ITUSL Proviue £ V4 equivdieriL yidiiis per serviny d |
or approved equa
210| 40 | CASE | 48250z o=
Pizza, Breakfast Pizza, 51% Whole Grain, Bacon Scramble. Tony's #78353 FSA | $ 5767 | $ 56.65
Product must provide 10z M/IMA and 1.50z equivalent grains per
CN label. or approved equal
211 50 CASE |128/2.950z
Pizza, Big Daddy's. 16" Primo, 51% Whole Grain Cheese Pizza. |gchwan's #78637 FSA |$ 74.08  $ 73.04
Product must provide 2 oz M/MA and 2 oz Equivalent Grains per
CN label. or approved equal
212 20 CASE | 72/518 0z
Pizza, Tony's 4x6 Cheese Pizza, Whole Grain. Product must Tony's #78697 FsA | $ 4729 ¢ 46.15
provide 2 oz M/MA and 2 oz Equivalent Grains per CN Label.
or approved equal
213 25 CASE 96/4.50z
Cheese SFicks, Bosco's, Whole Grain, .6", Reducgd Fat. Product [g,qc0's #702011-1120
must provide 1 0z M/MA and 1 oz Equivalent Grains per CN
label. or approved equal
214 50 CASE | 144/2.10z
Bosco's #802011-1120 Fsa | $ 55.00 [ $ 54.21
- PRICE PER PRICE PER
ITI'I| QTyY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE FOB CASE FOB
= SOLDOTNA ANCHORAGE
#*
Pizza Stick, Bosco's, Whole Grain, 7". Product must provide 1 0z |gosco's #702372-1120 FSA $ 37771 $ 37.05
M/MA and 2 oz Equivalent Grains per CN Label.
21R AN NAQE 7212 7R A= or approved equal
BID #124-17 2nd Quarter
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Potatoes, Wedges, Seasoned Jo Jo's, Ovenable, No Trans Fat. || amb Weston #A10
Simplot #473015 FSA |$ 30731 $ 29.45
216 80 CASE 6/5# or approved equal
Egg Roll, Chicken, 51% Whole Grain, Minh. Product must provide [\1iNH #69461 FSA | $ 36.04 | $ 35.54
1 0z M/MA, 1 oz Equivalent Grains and 1/4 Cup Vegetable.
Product must have a CN label. or approved equal
217 80 CASE 60/3 oz
Chicken, Popcorn, Breaded, Whole Grain, Fully Cooked Popcorn Tyson #70368-928 FsA | § 66.75 | $ 65.32
Chicken. Each serving must provide 2 oz M/MA and 1 oz
Equivalent Grains per CN label. or approved equal
218 50 CASE | 156/3.30z
Sausage, Low Fat, Low Sodium, Skinless, Pre Cooked, Gluten-  {j5nes Dairy Farm #028510 FsA | $ 2539 | $ 24.95
Free. Product must be CN labeled and contain no lard, tropical _
oils or MSG. One link must provide 1/2 0z MIMA per CN label. | Quincy Street #012007
219 50 CASE 10# or approved equal
- PRICE PER PRICE PER
H QTyY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE FOB CASE FOB
= SOLDOTNA ANCHORAGE
#
Turkey, Sliced, Oven Roasted, Lower Sodium, .5 oz slices Hormel #32232 FsA | § 7051 | $ 69.99
Jenni-O #8868
220 15 CASE 6/24 or approved equal
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Cookie, Chocolate Chip with M&M, 51% Whole Grain. Best Maid #71190
Baker Boy #14161 FSA |$ 4370 $ 43.06
221 50 CASE 240/1 oz or approved equal
Vegetable, Winter Blend, No Carrots, 60% Broccoli 40% Simplot #10071179188070 FSA $ 30.38 $ 29.37
Cauliflower.
Norpac #03069
222 10 CASE 12/2# Sig 5 Star #48698
or approved equal
Rice, Whole Grain, Vegetable Fried Rice. Minh #69074 FSA | $ 5343 | $ 52.93
or approved equal
223| 30 | CASE | 845590z =
Cheese, Cheddar, American Sliced, 50% Reduced Fat, 50% Land O Lakes #46288 FSA |$ 8207 |$ 80.82
Reduced Sodium, Pasteurized Processed. Each serving must
provide 1 0z M/MA per CN Label. or approved equal
224 10 CASE 6/5#
- PRICE PER PRICE PER
ITI'I| QTyY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE FOB CASE FOB
= SOLDOTNA ANCHORAGE
#*
Salisbury Steak. Product Must Provide 2.00 oz M/MA per Serving [ 7T\ #CP5632 FSA | No Bid No Bid
for Child Nutrtition Meal Pattern Requirments. No Known QTY. p I
or approved equa
25| 0 | cASE | 30# e
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Beef Hot Dogs, 6", CN Labeled, Product Must Provide 2.00 0z |Tyson #SL05395
M/MA per Serving for Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirments.
Made With 100% USDA inspected cuts of Beef with no fillers or ~ [°F @Pproved equal
226 44 CASE 96 ct/cs
Smithfield #70247810967 |FSA | $ 3316  $ 32.74
Meatloaf, Cheddar Cheese Added, Topped With Ketchup, Fully | aqvancePierre #68190 FSA | $ 76.19 [ $ 75.43
Cooked, CN Labeled. Product must provide 2.00 oz M/MA per
or approved equal
227 50 CASE | 100/2.90z
Macaroni and Cheese, Reduced Sodium and Fat. Product must || and O Lakes #43274 FSA $ 68.81 | $ 67.52
provide 2.00 oz M/MA and 1 oz equivalent grains per serving.
or approved equal
228 60 CASE 6/5#
Pepperoni, Turkey, Vac Pack. Hormel #32048 FSA |$ 3953 | $ 39.10
or approved equal
229 5 CASE 2/54#
No Award
- PRICE PER PRICE PER
H QTyY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE FOB CASE FOB
= SOLDOTNA ANCHORAGE
3
Ham, Smoked, Sliced, CN labeled. Hormel #32225 FSA | $ 5594 |$  55.42
or approved equal
230| 5 | cASE | ¢ P
Juice Bar, Minute Maid, Grape. Product must provide 1/4 cup J&J Snackfoods #3822 FSA No Bid No Bid
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1UU70 ITUIL JUICE PEI SEIVINg.
or approved equal
231 30 CASE | 100/2.250z
Corn Pup Dogs, Chicken, WG. Product must provide 20z MIMA  |Eoster Farms #96086 FsA | § 25.03 | $ 24.59
and 20z equivalent grains per CN label.
or approved equal
232 50 CASE 10#
Omelet, Colby Cheese. Product must provide 20z M/MA per CN Sunny Fresh #40176
label.
or approved equal
233 30 CASE | 225/2.10z
Sunny Fresh #10008161 FSA |$ 80.00 | $ 78.36
Pancakes, Mini, Cinnamon Roll, IW. Product must provide 20z |pinnacle #43568 FSA | $ 3158 | $ 30.87
equivalent grains per CN label..
or approved equal
234 40 CASE 72/3.20z
- PRICE PER PRICE PER
ITI1| QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE FOB CASE FOB
= SOLDOTNA ANCHORAGE
#*
Peppers & Onions, Flameroasted. CN labeled. Simplot #10071179677796 FSA | $ 3350 | $ 32.85
or approved equal
235| 20 | CASE | 6/2.5# e
Tortilla, 9", Tomato Basil, WG, Reduced Sodium. Product must  Tyson #24001-621 FSA No Bid No Bid
provide 20z equivalent grains per CN label.
or approved equal
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236 0 CASE | 12 dozen
Meatball, Beef, 0.50z per piece, Fully Cooked. Product must Advance Pierre #1-17-305-0 FSA | $ 108.22 | $ 106.94
provide 20z M/MA per CN label.
or approved equal
237 30 CASE | 192/2.50z
Philly Seasoned Beef Steak Slices. Product must provide 20z Advance Pierre #21310 FsA | § 5773 | $ 57.31
M/MA per CN label.
or approved equal
238 20 CASE 10#
Cheese, Parmesan, Grated. Kraft #00210006154500 FSA |$ 2087 | $ 20.65
or approved equal
239 5 CASE S#
- PRICE PER PRICE PER
|T|.|| QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE FOB CASE FOB
= SOLDOTNA ANCHORAGE
#
Rotini, Pre-Cooked, WG. Product must provide 20z equivalent  |p1arzetti #41308-31073 FSA | No Bid No Bid
grains per CN label. p I
or approved equa
240| 0 | CASE | 20# P
Cheese, Mozzarella made with part skim milk, Shredded, 5# bag. [Schreiber #54242 FSA $ 5446 | $ 53.60
Land O Lakes #41698
241 5 CASE 4/5% or approved equal
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Peanut Butter & Grape Jelly Sandwich on Whole Grain Bread,  |Advance Pierre #92123 FSA No Bid No Bid
Crustless, IW. Product to provide 1 0oz M/MA and 1 oz equivalent
grains per CN label. or approved equal
242 0 CASE 72/2.80z
Broccoli Cuts, Frozen, IQF. Simplot #80586 FSA | No Bid No Bid
Signature
243 0 CASE 12/2# or approved equal
Oatmeal, Steel Cut, Brown Sugar, Portion Packed. Product must [JTM #5991 FSA |§ 2016 | $ 28.62
provide 10z grain equivalent per CN label.
or approved equal
244 45 CASE 30/60z
- PRICE PER PRICE PER
|T|1| QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE FOB CASE FOB
= SOLDOTNA ANCHORAGE
#*
Juice, Apple, Frozen, Foil Top Cup, 4 oz liquid, 100% Juice Sig #62678 FSA |$ 20211$ 28.05
Ardmore #41381
245 160 CASE 96/40z Johanna
or approved equal
Juice, Orange, Frozen, Foil Top Cup, 4 oz liquid, 100% Juice Sig #62681 FsA | § 3420 | $ 33.04
Ardmore #41380
246 50 CASE 96/40z Johanna
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or approved equal
Spaghetti, Trayed Nest, Frozen, Whole Grain, Pre Cooked. Marzetti #41308-31050 FSA | No Bid No Bid
or approved equal
247 100 CASE 184#
Hamburger Bun, 51% Whole Grain, Baked, Sliced. Product must |gaker Boy #31014 FSA | No Bid No Bid
provide 2 0z equivalent grains per bun. oz Bakery 74329 (6/ 120K
ranz bake
48| 50 | CcASE | 120120z z Balery F4929 (112010
or approved equal
Baked Hot Dog Bun, 51% Whole Grain, Full Baked and Sliced.  |gaker Boy #31034 FSA | No Bid No Bid
or approved equal
249 | 50 | CASE | 144 ctlcs ppo=
- PRICE PER PRICE PER
|T|1| QTyY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE FOB CASE FOB
= SOLDOTNA ANCHORAGE
#*
Dinner Roll, Baked, 51% Whole Grain. Product must provide 1.25 |gaker Boy #31142 FSA No Bid No Bid
0z equivalent grains.
or approved equal
250 50 CASE | 6/30 ct/cs
Mini Garlic Bread, 51% Whole Grain, Brown & Serve. Product  |gaker Boy #20550 FSA | No Bid No Bid
must provide 1 o0z equivalent grains.
or approved equal
251 40 CASE 196/1 oz
BID #124-17 2nd Quarter
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Ciabatta Bread, WG. Product must proivide 20z equivalent grains | General Mills #137738000 FSA | No Bid No Bid
per CN label
or approved equal
252 30 CASE 96 ct/cs
Spaghetti, Trayed Nest, Frozen, Whole Grain, Pre Cooked. Marzetti #41308-20001 FSA No Bid No Bid
or approved equal
253 100 CASE 36/80z
- PRICE PER PRICE PER
|T|1| QTyY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE FOB CASE FOB
= SOLDOTNA ANCHORAGE
#*
Rofini, Tri-color, Frozen, Pre-cooked Marzetti #41308-26007 FSA | No Bid No Bid
or approved equal
254 15 CASE 6/3#
Lasagna Sheets, Frozen, Pre-cooked Marzetti #41308-24001 FSA | No Bid No Bid
or approved equal
255 40 CASE 48/50z
Toritilla, 10", Tomato Basil Flavored Wraps Tyson #7860-621 FSA No Bid No Bid
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or approved equal
256 15 CASE | 10dozen
Bread, White, Gluten-free, Frozen, Loaf Udi's #UGF809991 FSA No Bid No Bid
Franz #072220009941
257 10 CASE 6/300z or approved equal
BID #124-17 2nd Quarter
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