
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Re-Cap Bid #112-18
Award in Bold
* = Alternate;  > = No Brand name 
or Spec sheets provided Arctic Office Capital Office Fisher The Library Nasco Sargent School School Think Office Tiles in Style

Products Scientific Store Welch Outfitters Specialty LLC LLC

Cafeteria Table 2,300.00$    1,490.14$    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,671.02$    1,475.00$    1,910.18$    
KI Uniframe #UFRD58/PY-PR  

Desk, Double Pedestal 1,475.00$    1,137.25$    No Bid $1535.03 * No Bid No Bid 1,750.00$    $869.31 * No Bid $1071.83 *
Virco 53 Series  
#DESK-533060-MPL385-BLK01  

 
Desk, Double Pedestal 800.00$       958.59$       No Bid $1660.40 * No Bid No Bid $2050.00 * $878.08 * No Bid $1012.43 *
Bestar Office Embassy Collection  
#15310  

 
Table, Rectangle 550.00$       515.38$       No Bid 602.10$       No Bid No Bid 525.00$       433.30$       No Bid 542.63$       
Community Lincoln Series  
#LI3060  

 
Table, Flipper $430.00 * 449.20$       No Bid $637.34 * No Bid No Bid 335.00$       355.76$       No Bid $537.23 *
Learniture #LNT-TSU3035-PK-SO  

 
Replacement Science Table Top 475.00$       452.66$       No Bid No Bid No Bid 463.00$     No Bid 411.64$       No Bid $751.88 *
Diversified; Formaspace  

 
Table Desk, Library/Classroom 350.00$       387.71$       No Bid $513.24 * No Bid No Bid $515.00 * 278.34$       No Bid $460.28 *
Childcraft  

 
Table, Activity No Bid 1,384.95$    No Bid $1131.87 * No Bid No Bid No Bid 975.99$       657.00$       913.88$       
KI Pillar Boat #PLBT3672-74P  

 
File Cabinet, Vertical 790.00$       728.53$       No Bid 1,093.21$    No Bid No Bid 745.00$       647.07$       No Bid 684.38$       
Tennsco V284-MF  

 
Student Chair, Rocker 110.00$       101.31$       No Bid $226.68 * No Bid No Bid 170.00$       $109.93 * No Bid 141.68$       
Virco Zuma Series #ZROCK13  

 
Student Chair, Rocker 114.00$       105.04$       No Bid $226.68 * No Bid No Bid 174.00$       $117.42 * No Bid 144.38$       



Virco Zuma Series #ZROCK15  
 

Task Chair, Big and Tall $235.00 * 299.58$       No Bid $730.93 * No Bid No Bid $439.00 * $389.20 * No Bid $562.88 *
Serta Smart Layers Jennings  
Super #45314  

 
Task Chair $225.00 * 372.93$       No Bid $432.11 * No Bid No Bid No Bid $301.11 * No Bid $218.63 * >
Office Depot WorkPro  
Quantum 9000 Series #510830  

 
Sofa, Lounge No Bid 2,445.24$    No Bid 2,721.61$    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $778.88 *
Haba Lounge Seating #19-00831  

 
Armchair No Bid 1,676.04$    No Bid 1,608.10$    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $259.13 *
Haba Lounge Seating #19-00601  

 
Bench Seat, Inside Curve w/back No Bid 1,968.19$    No Bid $2452.40 * No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,880.50$    1,646.00$    2,305.73$    
KI MyPlace Loung Collection  
#MPICB-CGL-NC  

 
Bench Seat, Rectangle w/back No Bid 1,413.33$    No Bid $2302.31 * No Bid No Bid $499.00 * 1,260.47$    1,083.00$    1,486.28$    
KI MyPlace Lounge Collection  
#MPRB-CGL-NC  

 
Organizer, 30 Drawer 550.00$       574.48$       No Bid 952.85$       No Bid No Bid 640.00$       458.31$       No Bid 510.23$       
Tennsco #2085


