
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Recap Bid #117-18, Paper

Award in Bold

Arctic Office Lakeshore School Tiles in Veritiv WCP

Specialty Style

COPY PAPER 37.50$     No Bid $54.04  * 52.36$           $34.00 * 35.45$     

XEROX VITALITY MUTLIPURPOSE PRINTER #3R2047 

COPY PAPER $47.16 * No Bid No Bid 175.10$         54.95$           43.78$     

XEROX VITALITY PASTEL MULTIPURPOSE #3R11054; Hammermill Hammermill Domtar 81204

HAMMERMILL #1033425;  DOMTAR #81204 103325 103325

COPY PAPER $47.16 * No Bid No Bid $97.11 * $54.95 * 43.78$     

XEROX VITALITY PASTEL MULTIPURPOSE #3R110519; Domtar 81200

DOMTAR #81200

TEXT PAPER 123.50$   No Bid $150.20 * 124.75$         89.95$           74.91$     

WAUSAU PAPER Astrobrights #22641; 

NEENAH PAPER Astrobrights #22641 

TEXT PAPER 123.50$   No Bid $150.20 * 169.63$         89.95$           74.91$     

WAUSAU PAPER Astrobrights #22681

NEENAH PAPER Astrobrights #22681 

HAMMERMILL BRITE HUE (Ultra Fuschia)

CONSTRUCTION PAPER 4.49$       $3.71 * 3.77$       8.74$              3.70$             3.94$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103039; Pac 103039 Tru-Ray Tru-Ray 103039 Pac 103039 Pac 103039

PACON PEACOCK Series #P7712

CONSTRUCTION PAPER 4.42$       $3.71 * 3.55$       8.74$              2.50$             3.36$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103058; Pac 103058 Tru-Ray Tru-Ray 103058 Pac 103058 Pac 103058

PACON PEACOCK Series #8712



CONSTRUCTION PAPER 4.81$       $3.71 * $6.09 * 9.36$              3.55$             4.13$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103038; Pac 103038 Tru-Ray 103038 Pac 103038 Tru-Ray 103038

PACON PEACOCK Series #P8012 

CONSTRUCTION PAPER 4.81$       $3.71 * 4.72$       9.36$              3.25$             3.66$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103054; Pac 103054 Tru-Ray Tru-Ray 103054 Pac 103054 Tru-Ray 103054

PACON PEACOCK Series #P7412

CONSTRUCTION PAPER 2.27$       $2.04  * 3.03$       8.74$              1.95$              1.94$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103022; Pac 103022 Tru-Ray Tru-Ray 103022 Pac 103022 Tru-Ray 103022

PACON PEACOCK Series #P7409

CONSTRUCTION PAPER 2.27$       $2.04 * 4.58$       3.11$              1.85$             2.09$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103024; Tru-Ray Tru-Ray 103024 Pac 103024 Tru-Ray 103024

PACON PEACOCK Series #P6809

CONSTRUCTION PAPER 2.27$       $2.04 * 3.18$       3.74$              1.79$             2.09$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103006; Pac 103006 Tru-Ray Tur-Ray 103006 Pac 103006 Tru-Ray 103006

PACON PEACOCK Series #P8009

CONSTRUCTION PAPER 2.27$       $2.04 * 2.73$       4.11$              1.79$             1.99$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103431; Pac 103431 Tru-Ray Tru-Ray 103431 Pac 103431 Tru-Ray 103431

PACON PEACOCK Series #P9909

CONSTRUCTION PAPER 2.18$       $2.04 * 2.93$       8.74$              1.89$              1.77$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103018; Pac 103018 Tru-Ray Tru-Ray 103018 Pac 103018 Tru-Ray 103018

PACON PEACOCK Series #P7109

CONSTRUCTION PAPER 2.31$       $2.04 * 2.88$       8.74$              No Bid 1.82$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103004; Pac 103004 Tru-Ray Tru-Ray 103004 Tru-Ray 103004

PACON PEACOCK Series #P8409



CONSTRUCTION PAPER 2.27$       $2.04 * 3.02$       3.11$              No Bid 2.09$       

PACON TRU-RAY Series #103423; Pac 103423 Tru-Ray Tru-Ray 103423  Tru-Ray 103423

PACON PEACOCK Series #P9609

BUTCHER PAPER 87.69$     No Bid 67.46$     96.88$           No Bid 73.30$     

PACON SPECTRA DUO-FINISH ARTKRAFT #6730-1  

EASEL PAD $12.69 * $11.15 * $7.03 * 29.36$           9.25$             12.55$     

PACON #3386; ESSELTE AMPAD 24-034R Pac 3386 Pac 3386 Pac 3386

GRAPH PAPER 11.35$     $9.29 * 14.12$     15.24$           7.40$             9.01$       

PACON #2862;   SCHOOL SMART #085627 Pac 2862 School Smart Pac 2862 Pac 2862 Pac 2862

GRAPH PAPER 11.35$     No Bid 14.12$     19.24$           7.40$             9.01$       

PACON #2863;   SCHOOL SMART #085475 Pac 2863 School Smart Pac 2863 Pac 2863 Pac 2863

LEGAL PAD $1.147 * No Bid $1.62 * $2.00 * No Bid No Bid

ESSELTE AMPAD #20-263; STAPLES #163857


