
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Re-Cap Bid #116-18

Award in Bold

* = Draw CDW-G GCSIT Meridian Mvation Saitech Inc

Systems Inc Worldwide Inc

Dell Latitude 5490 No Bid 879.00$    1,258.00$ 1,218.00$ No Bid

XCTO Laptop

Dell Latitude 3380 No Bid 575.00$    740.00$     824.00$     No Bid

CTO Laptop

Dell Latitude 3380 No Bid 696.00$    1,004.00$ 1,004.00$ No Bid

CTO Laptop

Dell Latitude 5050 SFF No Bid 595.00$    803.00$     772.00$     No Bid

XCTO Desktop

Dell PowerEdge T630 No Bid 6,250.00$ 7,422.00$ 6,298.88$ 6,300.00$ 

Server

Dell Chromebook 11 No Bid No Bid 268.00$    303.88$     No Bid

3180, BTX

Google Chrome OS No Bid No Bid 28.00$       23.58$       No Bid

Management Console

License, Education

Dell Business Dock No Bid 172.00$    186.00$     192.98$     No Bid

Dell Monitor No Bid 139.00$    151.00$     169.88$     No Bid

Dell USB Soundbar No Bid 24.00$       $24.00 * 25.88$       No Bid

DVD Drive, External No Bid No Bid 32.00$       39.98$       29.00$       

Laptop Bag No Bid No Bid 12.00$       10.98$       No Bid

Cart, Charging 1,266.05$ No Bid 1,332.00$ 1,588.00$ 1,349.00$ 

36-bay

Cart, Charging 554.09$    No Bid 741.00$     718.00$     619.00$     

16-bay


