

**Kenai Peninsula Borough School District  
 Bid #129-18 Recap - Toner Cartridges  
 Award is in bold**

		ABC Laser USA	Adorama	AK A/V & Data Supply	Arctic Office	Lewis & Lewis	The Office Pal	Pitney Bowes	Prints Charles Reprographics	Quill.com	Redmond Thenology	Taza Supplies
#010310	HEWLETT PACKARD #F6U64AN#140 BLACK INK CARTRIDGE	\$31.25	\$29.10	\$31.05	\$30.803	\$29.75	\$30.59	<b>\$28.43</b>	\$37.25	NO BID	NO BID	\$43.92
#010311	HEWLETT PACKARD # F6U63AN#140 TRI-COLOR INK CARTRIDGE	\$32.75	\$30.80	\$32.42	\$32.188	\$31.08	\$32.29	<b>\$29.80</b>	\$38.71	NO BID	NO BID	\$46.36
#010312	HEWLETT PACKARD #F6U19AN#140 BLACK INK CARTRIDGE	\$38.25	\$41.50	\$38.08	\$37.670	\$36.27	<b>\$32.39</b>	\$35.07	\$44.41	NO BID	NO BID	\$53.66
#010313	HEWLETT PACKARD #L0S61AN#140 CYAN INK CARTRIDGE	\$30.25	\$31.35	\$29.31	\$28.809	\$27.83	\$28.89	<b>\$16.49</b>	\$35.14	NO BID	NO BID	\$41.48
#010314	HEWLETT PACKARD #L0S67AN#140 YELLOW INK CARTRIDGE	\$30.25	\$31.35	\$29.31	\$28.809	\$27.83	\$28.89	<b>\$16.49</b>	\$35.14	NO BID	NO BID	\$41.48
#010315	HEWLETT PACKARD #L0S64AN#140 MAGENTA INK CARTRIDGE	\$30.25	\$31.35	\$29.31	\$28.809	\$27.83	\$28.89	<b>\$16.49</b>	\$35.14	NO BID	NO BID	\$41.48
#010316	HEWLETT PACKARD #C2P23AN#140 BLACK INK CARTRIDGE	\$29.25	NO BID	\$29.12	\$28.678	<b>\$27.70</b>	\$28.46	NO BID	\$35.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$40.26
#010317	HEWLETT PACKARD #C2P24AN#140 CYAN INK CARTRIDGE	\$19.25	NO BID	\$18.51	\$18.214	<b>\$17.73</b>	\$18.26	NO BID	\$24.05	NO BID	NO BID	\$26.84
#010318	HEWLETT PACKARD #C2P25AN#140 MAGENTA INK CARTRIDGE	\$19.25	NO BID	\$18.51	\$18.214	<b>\$17.73</b>	\$18.26	NO BID	\$24.05	NO BID	NO BID	\$26.84
#010319	HEWLETT PACKARD #C2P26AN#140 YELLOW INK CARTRIDGE	\$19.25	NO BID	\$18.51	\$18.214	<b>\$17.73</b>	\$18.26	NO BID	\$24.05	NO BID	NO BID	\$26.84
#010320	HEWLETT PACKARD #CN053AN#140 BLACK INK CARTRIDGE	\$31.25	<b>\$26.39</b>	\$30.69	\$30.466	\$29.33	\$30.16	\$26.72	\$36.78	NO BID	NO BID	\$43.92
#010321	HEWLETT PACKARD #CN054AN#140 CYAN INK CARTRIDGE	\$16.75	\$17.40	\$16.01	\$15.794	\$15.31	\$15.71	<b>\$13.22</b>	\$21.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.18
#010322	HEWLETT PACKARD #CN055AN#140 MAGENTA INK CARTRIDGE	\$16.75	\$17.40	\$15.95	\$15.794	\$15.31	\$15.71	<b>\$13.22</b>	\$21.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.18
#010323	HEWLETT PACKARD #CN056AN#140 YELLOW INK CARTRIDGE	\$16.75	\$17.40	\$16.01	\$15.794	\$15.31	\$15.71	<b>\$13.22</b>	\$21.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.18
#010718	HEWLETT PACKARD #CE505X BLACK TONER	\$147.50	\$155.90	\$119.64	\$147.128	<b>\$112.09</b>	\$155.54	\$128.64	\$159.43	NO BID	\$140.00	\$223.26
#010719	HEWLETT PACKARD #CE260A BLACK TONER	\$145.00	\$149.80	\$123.33	\$144.469	<b>\$114.66</b>	\$149.59	\$126.88	\$156.42	NO BID	NO BID	\$214.72
#010721	HEWLETT PACKARD #CC364X BLACK TONER	\$275.50	\$278.35	\$230.51	\$277.983	<b>\$211.97</b>	\$289.84	\$244.05	\$294.21	NO BID	NO BID	\$416.02
#010750	HEWLETT PACKARD #CE410X BLACK TONER	\$93.25	\$104.10	\$76.95	\$93.195	<b>\$72.54</b>	\$97.74	\$83.48	\$106.04	NO BID	\$92.00	\$140.30
#010751	HEWLETT PACKARD #CE412A YELLOW TONER	\$108.00	\$119.30	\$89.20	\$107.975	<b>\$84.02</b>	\$112.19	\$95.13	\$120.81	NO BID	\$115.00	\$161.04
#010752	HEWLETT PACKARD #CE413A MAGENTA TONER	\$108.00	\$120.30	\$89.20	\$107.975	<b>\$84.02</b>	\$112.19	\$95.13	\$120.81	NO BID	\$115.00	\$161.04
#010753	HEWLETT PACKARD #CE411A CYAN TONER	\$108.00	\$119.30	\$89.20	\$107.975	<b>\$84.02</b>	\$112.19	\$95.13	\$120.81	NO BID	\$115.00	\$161.04