
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Bid #106-19 Recap - Paper

Award is in bold

* = Alternate
Lakeshore School Quill.com Veritiv
Learning Specialty Inc.

#020950 COVERSTOCK - PASTEL BLUE NO BID $36.22 NO BID $11.95

SPRINGHILL VELLUM #26000, DOMTAR #81042 

#020951 COVERSTOCK - GRAY NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.95

NEENAH EXACT VELLUM #82341 

#020958 COVERSTOCK - PASTEL PINK NO BID $36.22 NO BID $11.95

NEENAH EXACT VELLUM #82441, DOMTAR #81041 

#021023 COVERSTOCK - GAMMA GREEN NO BID $36.22 NO BID $17.30

NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #22741 

#021024 COVERSTOCK - BLUE (TERRESTRIAL TEAL) NO BID $36.22 NO BID $17.65

NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #21855,  

WAUSAU ASTROBRIGHT #22109

#021025 COVERSTOCK - COSMIC ORANGE NO BID $36.22 NO BID $17.65

NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #22851 

#021028 COVERSTOCK - WHITE NO BID $27.50 NO BID $11.30*

NEENAH EXACT VELLUM #82211, DOMTAR #81036 

#021130 CONSTRUCTION PAPER  - BLACK 12 X 18 $4.51 $5.59 NO BID $2.90

PACON TRU-RAY #103061, PACON PEACOCK #P6312 
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#021131 CONSTRUCTION PAPER  - DARK BLUE 12 X 18 $4.51 $5.66* NO BID $3.70*

PACON PEACOCK #P7312 

#021134 CONSTRUCTION PAPER  - FESTIVE GREEN 12 X 18 $4.51 $5.91 NO BID $3.70

PACON TRU-RAY #103038, PACON PEACOCK #P8012

#021136 CONSTRUCTION PAPER - FESTIVE RED 12 X 18 $4.51 $5.66 NO BID $3.60

PACON TRU-RAY #103050, PACON PEACOCK #P7112 

#021138 CONSTRUCTION PAPER - LILAC 12 X 18 $4.51 $5.45 NO BID $3.40

PACON TRU-RAY #103050, PACON PEACOCK #P7112 

#021140 CONSTRUCTION PAPER - PINK 12 X 18 $4.51 $5.59 NO BID $3.30

PACON TRU-RAY #103044, PACON PEACOCK #P7012 

#021143 CONSTRUCTION PAPER - WHITE 12 X 18 $4.51 $5.03 NO BID $2.65

PACON TRU-RAY #103058, PACON PEACOCK #P8712 

#021144 CONSTRUCTION PAPER - YELLOW 12 X 18 $4.51 $5.53 NO BID $3.15

PACON TRU-RAY #103036, PACON PEACOCK #P8412 

#021150 CONSTRUCTION PAPER - BLUE 12 X 18 $4.51 $5.66 NO BID $3.25

PACON TRU-RAY #103054, PACON PEACOCK #P7412

#021155 CONSTRUCTION PAPER - BLACK 9 X 12 $2.47 $2.80 NO BID $2.08

PACON TRU-RAY #103029, PACON PEACOCK #P6309 

#021160 CONSTRUCTION PAPER - FESTIVE GREEN 9 X 12 $2.47 $3.06 NO BID $1.86

PACON TRU-RAY #103006, PACON PEACOCK #P8009 

#021161 CONSTRUCTION PAPER - FESTIVE RED 9 X 12 $2.47 $2.82 NO BID $1.86

PACON TRU-RAY #103431, PACON PEACOCK #P9909 
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#021164 CONSTRUCTION PAPER - ORANGE 9 X 12 $2.47 $2.92 NO BID $1.99

PACON TRU-RAY #103002, PACON PEACOCK #P6609 

#021168 CONSTRUCTION PAPER - WHITE 9 X 12 $2.47 $2.65 NO BID $1.80

PACON TRU-RAY #103026, PACON PEACOCK #P8709 

#021177 CONSTRUCTION PAPER - BURGUNDY 9 X 12 $2.47 $2.96* NO BID $1.98*

PACON PEACOCK #P9009 

#021187 COPY PAPER - GREEN 8.5 X 11 NO BID $122.00 NO BID $51.95*

XEROX VITALITY #3R11051, DOMTAR  #81197 

#021190 COPY PAPER - GOLDENROD 8.5 X 11 NO BID $121.20* NO BID $53.90

XEROX VITALITY #3R11055, HAMMERMILL #10316-8 

#021191 COPY PAPER - WHITE 8.5 X 11 NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.95* NO AWARD

XEROX VITALITY #3R2047 only

#021328 NOTEBOOK, WIREBOUND (1 SUBJECT) NO BID $5.44 NO BID NO BID

MEAD #06206, STAPLES #918953 

#021350 PAD, STENOGRAPHER’S 6 X 9 NO BID $1.29 NO BID NO BID

STAPLES #163485, SCHOOL SMART #085290 

#021360 PAD, LEGAL - YELLOW 8.5 X 11 NO BID $.91* NO BID NO BID

AMPAD #20-420, STAPLES #163840 

#021367 PAD, LEGAL - YELLOW 5 X 8 NO BID $0.45 NO BID NO BID

SCHOOL SMART #027439, STAPLES #163832 

#021397 TAGBOARD - MANILA 24 X 36 NO BID $5.19 NO BID $0.2825
PACON #5126 
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