Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #116-19 Recap - Paper

Award is in bold

* = Alternate

#020950

#020952

#020958

#020960

#021019

#021021

#021025

#021026

1of6

COVERSTOCK - PASTEL BLUE
SPRINGHILL VELLUM #26000, DOMTAR #81042

COVERSTOCK - PASTEL GREEN
NEENAH EXACT VELLUM #82351, SPRINGHILL
VELLUM #04600, WAUSAU #82351

COVERSTOCK - PASTEL PINK
NEENAH EXACT VELLUM #82441, DOMTAR #81041
SPRINGHILL VELLUM #076000

COVERSTOCK - PASTEL YELLOW
NEENAH EXACT VELLUM #82331, DOMTAR #81044,
WAUSAU #82331

COVERSTOCK - PULSAR PINK
NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #21041, WAUSAU #22821

COVERSTOCK - SOLAR YELLOW
NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #22731, WAUSAU #22731

COVERSTOCK - COSMIC ORANGE
NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #22851

COVERSTOCK - RE-ENTRY RED
NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #22751, WAUSAU #

Arctic Office

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Grainger

$29.80 *

$29.26

No Bid

$29.80

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

School
Specialty

$31.10 *

$25.10

No Bid

$24.88 *

$25.10

$24.88

$25.10

$31.98

Staples

$13.80*

$12.82

$38.20

$12.82

$18.10

$13.80

$14.50

$14.50

Veritiv

$13.40 *

$13.40

$13.40

$13.40

$17.50

$17.50

$17.50

$17.50

Domtar

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #116-19 Recap - Paper

Award is in bold

* = Alternate

#020127

#021028

#021041

#021065

#021066

#021067

#021102

#021103

#021105

20of6

COVERSTOCK - GRAVITY GRAPE (DARK PURPLE)
NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #21971

COVERSTOCK - WHITE
NEENAH EXACT VELLUM #82211, DOMTAR #81036
SPRINGHILL VELLUM #16000

TEXT PAPER - RENTRY RED
NEENAN #22551, WAUSAU #22551

EASEL PAD 27 X 34 UNRULED
PACON #3385, AMPAD EFFICIENCY #24-028,
SCHOOL SMART #1467042

EASEL PAD 27 X 34 RULED
PACON #3386, AMPAD EFFICIENCY #24-034

EASEL PAD 25X 30.5
3M POST-IT #559 only

BUTCHER PAPER - WHITE
PACON ARTKRAFT #67001

BUTCHER PAPER - CANARY
PACON ARTKRAFT #67081

BUTCHER PAPER - DARK BLUE
PACON ARTKRAFT #67181, PACON #5018, RIVERSIDE #759

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$16.64 *

$16.64 *

$22.75

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$28.48

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$76.57 *

No Bid

No Bid

$31.98

$23.10 *

$31.10*

$7.14

$7.39 *

$21.11

$51.22

$71.55

$59.11

$32.66

$16.26

$14.50

$18.48 *

$11.10 *

$12.18

$75.25

$88.68

$77.36

$17.50

$11.95*

$11.30

$10.95

$9.75

No Bid

$55.25

$69.90

$56.90

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #116-19 Recap - Paper

Award is in bold

* = Alternate

#021130

#021131

#021133

#021134

#021136

#021137

#021139

#021140

#021142

#021143

30f6

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - BLACK 12 X 18
PACON TRU-RAY #103061, PACON PEACOCK #P6312

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - DARK BLUE 12 X 18
PACON TRU-RAY #103049, PACON PEACOCK #P7312

CONTSTRUCTION PAPER - DARK BROWN 12 X 18
PACON TRU-RAY #103056, PACON PEACOCK #P6812

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - FESTIVE GREEEN (HOLIDAY) 12 X 18
PACON TRU-RAY #103038, PACON PEACOCK #P8012

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - FESTIVE RED (HOLIDAY) 12 X 18
PACON TRU-RAY #103432, PACON PEACOCK #P9912

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - SKY BLUE 12 X 18
PACON TRU-RAY #103048, PACON PEACOCK #P7612

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - ORANGE 12 X 18
PACON TRU-RAY #103034, PACON PEACOCK #P6612

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - PINK 12 X 18
PACON TRU-RAY #103044, PACON PEACOCK #P7012

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - VIOLET 12 X 18
PACON TRU-RAY #103041, PACON PEACOCK #P7212

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - WHITE 12 X 18
PACON TRU-RAY #103058, PACON PEACOCK #P8712

$5.15

$5.15

$5.15

$5.49

$5.10

$5.50

$5.50

$4.91

$5.15

$4.99

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3.66

$4.57

$4.57

$4.57

$4.57

$4.57

$4.57

$4.57

$4.57

$4.57

$4.47

$4.47

$4.27

$4.47

$4.47

$4.47

$4.47

$4.47

$4.47

$4.47

$2.90

$3.70

$3.60

$3.70

$3.60

$3.60

$3.40

$3.42

$3.38

$2.78

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #116-19 Recap - Paper

Award is in bold

* = Alternate

#021144

#021145

#021150

#021151

#021156

#021158

#021160

#021161

#021164

#021167
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CONSTRUCTION PAPER - YELLOW 12 X 18
PACON TRU-RAY #103036, PACON PEACOCK #P8412

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - LIME 12 X18
PACON TRU-RAY #103425, PACON PEACOCK #P9612

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - BLUE 12 X 18
PACON TRU-RAY #103054, PACON PEACOCK #P7412

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - ASSORTED COLORS 12 X 18
PACON RIVERSIDE #103638

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - BLUE9 X 12
PACON TRU-RAY #103022, PACON PEACOCK #P7409

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - BROWN 9 X 12
PACON TRU-RAY #103024, PACON PEACOCK #P6809

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - FESTIVE GREEN 9 X 12
PACON TRU-RAY #103006, PACON PEACOCK #P8009

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - FESTIVE RED 9 X 12
PACON TRU-RAY #103431, PACON PEACOCK #P9909

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - ORANGE 9 X 12
PACON TRU-RAY #103002, PACON PEACOCK #P6609

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - VIOLET 9 X 12
PACON TRU-RAY #103009, PACON PEACOCK #P7209

$5.15

$5.10

$5.50

$3.30

$2.53

$2.53

$2.53

$2.53

$2.60

$2.60

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$4.57

$4.57

$4.57

$4.49

$2.57

$2.57

$2.57

$2.57

$2.57

$2.57

$4.47

$4.47

$4.47

$3.48

$2.62

$2.29

$2.62

$2.24

$2.29

$2.17

$3.55

$3.80

$3.49

$3.48

$2.15

$1.85

$1.86

$1.99

$1.99

$1.95

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #116-19 Recap - Paper

Award is in bold

* = Alternate

#021168

#021169

#021170

#021173

#021181

#021186

#021188

#021189

#021191

50f6

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - WHITE9 X 12
PACON TRU-RAY #103026, PACON PEACOCK #P8709

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - YELLOW 9 X 12
PACON TRU-RAY #103004, PACON PEACOCK #P8409

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - LIME 9 X 12
PACON TRU-RAY (BRILLIANT LIME) #103423,
PACON PEACOCK (HOT LIME) #P9609

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - ROYAL BLUE 9 X 12
PACON TRU-RAY #103017, PACON PEACOCK #P7309

COPY PAPER - LILAC8.5X 11
XEROX VITALITY #3R11059, DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE #81200

COPY PAPER - BLUE 8.5 X 11
XEROX VITALITY #3R11050, HAMMERMILL #10330-9

COPY PAPER - PINK 8.5 X 11
XEROX VITALITY #3R11052, HAMMERMILL #10338-2,
CASCADE #BCPMP2201PK

COPY PAPER - YELLOW 8.5 X 11
XEROX VITALITY #3R11053, HAMMERMILL #10334-1

COPY PAPER - WHITE 8.5 X 11
XEROX VITALITY #3R2047 only

$2.60

$2.60

$2.52

$2.60

$53.00 *

$53.00 *

$53.00 *

$53.00 *

$45.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$62.20

$2.57

$2.57

$2.57

$1.99 *

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2.62

$2.62

$2.29

$2.35

$73.40*

$73.40 *

$73.40*

$73.40

$33.54 *

$1.75

$2.16

$2.25

$2.20

$53.90 *

$53.90

$53.90

$53.90

$39.95 *

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #116-19 Recap - Paper

Award is in bold

* = Alternate

#021198

#021322

#021325

#021327

#021328

#021331

#021350

#021361

#021367

#021397
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COPY PAPER - WHITE 11 X 17
XEROX VITALITY #3R3761, HAMMERMILL TIDAL #162024

NOTEBOOK, ASSIGNMENT (STUDENT PLANNER)
HAMMOND & STEPHENS (SCHOOL SPECIALTY #1473686)

NOTEBOOK FILLER PAPER 8.5X 11
APC #140P200, SCHOOL SMART #085289,
PACON MMK09213, SPARCO #SPR82120

NOTEBOOK, WIREBOUND 6 X 9.5
STAPLES SUSTAINABLE EARTH #749565

NOTEBOOK, WIREBOUND (1 SUBJECT)
MEAD #06206, STAPLES #918953

MAT BOARD (PEBBLED) 32 X 40
CRESCENT (SCHOOL SPECIALTY #405165)

PAD, STENOGRAPHER’S 6 X 9
STAPLES #163485, SCHOOL SMART #085290

PAD, LEGAL - BLUE 8.5 X 11
TOPS #63120, AMPAD #20-670

PAD, LEGAL - YELLOW 5 X 8
SCHOOL SMART #027439, STAPLES #163832

TAGBOARD - MANILA 24 X 36
PACON #PC5126

$95.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$4.55

No Bid

$2.40*

$2.35

$.81*

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.46

$3.27

$4.55 *

$5.58

$5.21

$1.32

$2.56

$0.53

$0.46

$37.67 *

$3.79 *

$3.54 *

$1.42

$1.96

No Bid

$1.12

$2.26

$0.53

$0.71

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.31

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



