KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

- Page 1 of?
Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue RECAP
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
where k|ds come first (907) 714-8876 Bid #117-19

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}

Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted
076015 |AIR FRESHENER/ODOR AlH $2.25 Alt. AlH $2.25
ELINATOR ConServ Flag Company No Bid
EA Fastenal $3.79 Alt
Pyramid School Products $8.99 Alt
Size -9.7 0z - Meadows & Rain veritiv $4.90 Alt
Staples $3.11 Alt
Brand |FEBREZE AIR EFFECTS Waxie No Bid
WCP Solutions $3.40 Alt
076020 |BAGS, VACUUM AlH No Bid Waxie $10.37
ConServ Flag Company $11.89
pkg Fastenal No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 10 quart Veritiv $14.95
Staples $12.27
Brand |PRO TEAM # 100331 Waxie $10.37
WCP Solutions $10.99
076040 |BLADES, UTILITY KNIFE AlH $15.29 Fastenal $11.60
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
pkg Fastenal $11.60 Alt
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 2-7/16" Veritiv No Bid
Staples $1.19 Alt *
Brand |STANLEY #11-921A Waxie No Bid
WCP Solutions No Bid
076055 [BLEACH, AlH $7.35 NO AWARD
CONCENTRATED ConServ Flag Company No Bid
EA  |REGULAR Fastenal $6.48
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -121 Fl. Oz. Veritiv $4.13 Alt **
Staples $6.52
Brand |CLOROX REGULAR 30966 \Waxie $5.39 Alt
B00S714B40 WCP Solutions $8.29

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL
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Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}
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076056 |DISINFECTING WIPES AlH $4.17* NO AWARD
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
pkg Fastenal $19.77
Pyramid School Products $13.99 Alt
. Veritiv $5.25 Alt
Size - 7" x 8” - 78 per pk
Perpxg Staples $5.48 Alt
Brand |CLOROX #1189436, SAM'S \Waxie $11.00 Alt
277253 WCP Solutions $5.45
076065 [BROOM, ANGLE HEADED AIH $27.83 Alt Fastenal $3.97
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
€a Fastenal $3.97 Alt
Pyramid School Products $12.99
Size - Veritiv $9.25
Staples $6.93 Alt
Brand |PREMIER #60804, Waxie $4.98 Alt.
RUBBERMAID BRUTE WCP Solutions $10.30
R6375-67
076068 [BROOM, PUSH (FINE) AlH $20.69 Alt Fastenal $10.65
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
€a Fastenal $10.65 Alt
Pyramid School Products $19.98 Alt
Size - 247 Veritiv No Bid
Staples $16.90 Alt
Brand FNAXIE #050210, Waxie $16.19
GRAINGER #3H388 WCP Solutions No Bid
076070 |BRUSH, COUNTER AlH $6.08 Alt Staples $4.17
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
€a Fastenal $7.34
Pyramid School Products $7.99 Alt
Size -g" Veritiv $5.95
Staples $4.17 Alt
Brand [STAPLES #73302, Waxie $7.42 Alt
CARLISLE #3621123 WCP Solutions No Bid

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL
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076121 |CAN, GARBAGE AlH $31.34 Waxie $22.33
ConServ Flag Company $31.89
€a Fastenal $36.86
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 32 gallon - Gray veritiv $29.95
Staples $36.39
Brand [TOUGH GUY #5DMT2, Waxie $22.33
CONTICO HUSKEE #3200, WCP Solutions $25.80
RUBBERMAID BRUTE
2632
076215 [URINAL BLOCKS AlH No Bid Waxie $8.11
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
box Fastenal $8.87 Alt
Pyramid School Products $15.99 Alt
Size -4 o0z. blocks - Cherry Scent Veritiv No Bid
Staples $14.31 Alt
Brand |GRAINGER #27XE6 Waxie $8.11 Alt
WCP Solutions $9.20 Alt
076225 |DISINFECTANT SPRAY AlH $8.81 NO AWARD
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
ea Fastenal $10.58
Pyramid School Products $17.98
Size -19 oz. Veritiv $7.95
Staples $8.95 Alt
Brand [LYSOL DISINFECTANT Waxie $7.54
SPRAY WCP Solutions $7.85
076381 |LINERS, CAN AlH No Bid Veritiv $34.00
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
cse Fastenal No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -24"x33"-500/each/case veritiv $34.00
Staples $44.42 Alt
Brand |ALL PACKAGING Waxie $45.66 Alt
2433001CL, NORPLEX WCP Solutions $25.43 *

FB1-2433 CLEAR,
SHIELDS #33758-WA

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL
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076386 |LINERS, CAN AlH No Bid Veritiv $48.45
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
cse Fastenal No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Size: 33" x 45" — \S/te;'t:\és $48.45
200/each/case P $146_' /8 Al
Waxie No Bid
Brand |ALL PACKAGING #FB2 WCP Solutions $48.10 Alt **
-3345STARSEA, NORPLEX
82768, SHIELDS #30629-
A, REPUBLIC, REDI-BAG
3345002CL
076445 [MOP HEAD (WET) AlH $9.97 Alt Waxie $8.07
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
€a Fastenal $8.13 Alt
Pyramid School Products $13.98 Alt
Size -32 oz. - Large Veritiv $8.95 Alt
Staples $10.63 Alt
Brand |HILLYARD #24992 Waxie $8.07 Alt
WCP Solutions $11.60 Alt
076452 |PAD, BUFFER AlH No Bid Waxie $5.89
ConServ Flag Company $8.02
€a Fastenal $9.32
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 20" diameter - 1" thick - Red Veritiv $7.05
Staples $7.32
Brand |3M #5100 Waxie $5.89
WCP Solutions $6.69
076458 |PAD, HAND AlH $1.68 WCP $1.02
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
€a Fastenal $1.31
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -6x9, Maroon color only veritiv $1.25
Staples $1.47
Brand [3M SCOTCH-BRITE #7447 \Waxie $1.07
WCP Solutions $1.02

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL
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076466 [PAD, BUFFER AlH No Bid Waxie $3.81
ConServ Flag Company $5.20
ea Fastenal $5.76
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 15" diameter - 1” thick - Red veritiv $4.85
Staples $4.90
Brand [3M #5100 Waxie $3.81
WCP Solutions No Bid
076468 [PAD, BUFFER AlH No Bid Fastenal $5.26
ConServ Flag Company $15.33
ea Fastenal $5.26
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 14" x 20" - Red veritiv $6.85
Staples $9.37
Brand [3M #5100 Waxie $5.37
WCP Solutions No Bid
076485 |DRAIN AlH No Bid Veritiv $3.50
DEODORIZER/CLEANER ConServ Flag Company No Bid
qt Fastenal $6.30 Alt
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Quart Veritiv $3.50 Alt
Staples $6.04
Brand |SPARTAN #319703 Waxie $89.62/cse*
WCP Solutions $4.10
076511 |URINAL SCREEN AlH No Bid Veritiv $3.50
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
pkg Fastenal $3.70 Alt
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Citrus Scent 2/ea/pkg veritiv $3.50 Al
Staples $2.15 Alt *
Brand |WAXIE #161366 Waxie $3.79
WCP Solutions $2.56 Alt *

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL
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076512 |URINAL SCREEN AlH No Bid Veritiv $3.50
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
pkg Fastenal $3.88 Alt
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Herbal Mint 2/ea/pkg veritiv $3.50 Al
Staples $2.71 Alt *
Brand |WAXIE #161363 Waxie $3.79
WCP Solutions $2.56 Alt. *
076513 |URINAL SCREEN AlH No Bid Waxie $3.79
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
pkg Fastenal No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Cucumber Melon 2/ea/pkg veritiv $3.90 Al
Staples $2.71 Alt *
Brand |WAXIE #161361 Waxie $3.79
WCP Solutions No Bid
076522 |SEALER, FLOOR AlH No Bid WCP Solutions $19.85
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
gal Fastenal No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -1 gallon Veritiv $19.99
Staples $18.02 *
Brand |DIVERSEY OVER & Waxie $20.20
UNDER #4166 WCP Solutions $19.85
076542 |PALLET WRAP AlH $16.38 Alt Staples $6.67
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
rll Fastenal $14.99 Alt
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 15" x 1500’ 19.0 micron - \S/te”t:v $12.00
cast only aples $26.68/ctn 4
Waxie $11.59 Alt
WCP Solutions No Bid

Brand [STAPLES #1904058,
ERITIV #v00138

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL
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076565 |SOAP, LAUNDRY AlH No Bid NO AWARD
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
ea Fastenal $35.54 Alt 40#
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 28 Ibs. Veritiv $41.90 Alt 40#
Staples $18.88 Alt 50#
Brand |KIRKLAND #119903 Waxie $23.58 Alt 25#
WCP Solutions $65.70 Alt 17.86#
076641 |TISSUE, FACIAL AlH No Bid NO AWARD
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
box Fastenal No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -8.2" x 8.4" - 230 per box Veritiv $.70 Alt 100/sht *
Staples $1.04 Alt 95/sht *
Brand |KLEENEX TRUSTED CARE \Waxie $.62 Alt 100/sht *
WCP Solutions $.76 Alt 100/sht *
076645 |TOILET SEAT COVER AlH No Bid WCP Solutions $1.58
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
pkg Fastenal $57.00 Alt
Pyramid School Products $4.99 Alt
Size - Veritiv $2.75 Alt
Staples $1.72 Alt
Brand |JAMES RIVER #47046 Waxie $2.00 Alt
WCP Solutions $1.58 Alt
076670 |VINEGAR AlH No Bid NO AWARD
ConServ Flag Company No Bid
ea Fastenal No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
. . Veritiv No Bid
Size -1 gallon ju
gafion jug Staples $10.68 Alt
Brand |FOUR MONKS #740050 Waxie $10.92
-061215 WCP Solutions No Bid

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



