KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Page 1

where k|ds come first

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
(907) 714-8876

RECAP

of 1l

Bid #118-19

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}

Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted
010006 |BINDER, D RING Arctic Office Products $2.99 Arctic Office $2.99
Cascade School Supplies No Bid Products
ea National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -1” - White School Specialty No Bid
Staples $3.57 Alt
Brand |VVJ #38614W, BSN #28440
010007 |BINDER, D RING Arctic Office Products $4.05 Arctic Office $4.05
Cascade School Supplies No Bid Products
ea National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -2” - White School Specialty No Bid
Staples $4.00 *
Brand J #38644W, AVERY
17032
010020 |BINDER, ROUND RING Arctic Office Products $1.55 Arctic Office $1.55
Cascade School Supplies $3.64 Products
ea National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -1” - Black School Specialty No Bid
Staples $2.73 Alt
Brand |AVERY #05710
010056 |[BOOK RINGS Arctic Office Products $.115 School Specialty ~ $.06
Cascade School Supplies $2.17
ea National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -1"D - Silver School Specialty $.06
Staples $.06 Alt

Brand [SCHOOL SPECIALTY
036975, PYRAMID
1182641, CHARLES

LEONARD #R-29, OIC
0I1C99701

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Page 2 of 17
Purchasing Department B

139 E. Park Avenue RECAP
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
where k|ds come first - .
(907) 714-8876 Bid #118-19
Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}
010057 [BOX, BANKER Arctic Office Products $4.56 Cascade School  $4.32
Cascade School Supplies $4.32 Supplies
ea National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -12 x 15 x 10 School Specialty $5.09
Staples $3.87*
Brand |FELLOWS #00725
010069 |CALCULATOR, SOLAR Arctic Office Products $3.85 Alt Cascade School $1.35
Cascade School Supplies $1.35 Alt Supplies
ea National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -4 School Specialty No Bid
Staples $2.93 Alt
Brand |SHARP #EL-243C, SHARP
EL-243SB
010090 [CARDS, INDEX Arctic Office Products $.65 Staples $.54
Cascade School Supplies $.66 Alt
pkg National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -3" x 5 - White School Specialty $.89
Staples $.54 Alt
Brand |OXFORD #31, AMPAD
23300
010094 |CARDS, INDEX Arctic Office Products $1.10 Alt Cascade School $.81
Cascade School Supplies $.81 Alt Supplies
pkg National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -4” x 6” - White School Specialty $1.68
Staples $1.54 Alt

Brand [ESS41, SS #1380685

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

where k|ds come first

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669

(907) 714-8876

Bid #118-19

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}

Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted
010125 |CL|P, BUTTERFLY Arctic Office Products $1.79 Alt Cascade School $.95
Cascade School Supplies $.95 Alt Supplies
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Medium #2 School Specialty No Bid
Staples $1.19 Alt
Brand |CLI#402
010146 |c|_|p, BINDER Arctic Office Products $.37 Arctic Office $.37
Cascade School Supplies $.46 Alt Products
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -3/4” School Specialty $.42
Staples $.66
Brand |STAPLES #103523, SS
032397, OIC #99020
010147 |CLIP, BINDER Arctic Office Products $.91 Alt School Specialty $.62
Cascade School Supplies $.79
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -1-1/4” School Specialty $.62
Staples $1.24 Alt
Brand |STAPLES #395200,
SCHOOL SPECIALTY
032400
010152 [CLIP, PAPER Arctic Office Products $.69 Arctic Office $.69
Cascade School Supplies $.77 Products
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Jumbo School Specialty $1.02
Staples $.73

Brand [STAPLES #525923, ACCO

72580, OIC #99914, SS
084475

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT  page 4 of 1
Purchasing Department -

139 E. Park Avenue RECAP
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
where k|ds come first - .
(907) 714-8876 Bid #118-19
Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}
010158 |CONTACT PAPER Arctic Office Products No Bid School Specialty  $21.64
Cascade School Supplies $26.02 Alt
rll National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -18” x 60’ School Specialty $21,§4
Staples No Bid
Brand |MAGIC COVER #750
010171 |CORRECTION FLUID Arctic Office Products $1.09 Alt. Staples $.46
Cascade School Supplies $1.42
€a National Art & School Sup.  $.54 Alt
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 18 mil - White School Specialty $2.11
Staples $.46
Brand |PAPERMATE #2841178,
DIXON #31900, BIC #50367
010237 [ENVELOPE, REGULAR (V- Arctic Office Products $18.99 Alt Cascade School $11.10
BACK) Cascade School Supplies $11.10 Alt Supplies
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Regular #10 School Specialty $11.92
Staples $12.05
Brand |AMPAD #73213, STAPLES
187013, SCHOOL
SPECIALTY #085022
010242 [ERASER, ARROWHEAD Arctic Office Products $2.88 Alt Staples $.46
PENCIL CAP Cascade School Supplies $1.31 Alt
doz National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -Red School Specialty $1.58
Staples $.46
Brand |PAPERMATE #73015,
STAPLES #167601,
SCHOOL SPECIALTY
020754

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

where k|ds come first

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669

(907) 714-8876

Bid #118-19

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}

Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted
010243 |ERASER, MECHANICAL Arctic Office Products No Bid Staples $.37
PENCIL Cascade School Supplies No Bid
the National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
Staples $.37
Brand |PENTEL PENZ2-1
010245 |[ERASER, RUBBER Arctic Office Products No Bid Staples $3.11
Cascade School Supplies $6.30 Alt
doz National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 2-5/16" x 13/16” x 7/16" - ;C:C}g'ssr’ec'alty No Bid
Pink p $3.11
Brand |DIXON PINK CARNATION
38900
010255 [FASTENER, PRONG Arctic Office Products $2.22 Alt Arctic Office $2.22
(TWO-PIECE) Cascade School Supplies $2.40 Products
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 2-3/47x2" School Specialty No Bid
Staples $2.60 Alt
Brand |CL #60020, ACCO #70022
010260 [FASTENER, ROUND- Arctic Office Products No Bid Cascade School $.85
HEAD BRASS Cascade School Supplies  $.85 Supplies
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 1/2” Shank School Specialty $1.75
Staples $5.43

Brand |CL #2R-BP, SCHOOL

SPECIALTY #059946

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

. Page 6 of 17
% Purchasing Department
g s 139 E. Park Avenue RECAP
> Soldotna, Alaska 99669
where kids come first - .
(907) 714-8876 Bid #118-19
(Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}
010262 |[FASTENER, ROUND- Arctic Office Products $2.60 Alt School Specialty  $1.08
HEAD BRASS Cascade School Supplies $1.10 Alt
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -1” Shank School Specialty $1.08
Staples $1.10
Brand |SS #059952, CL #4RBP
010264 |FILES, HANGING Arctic Office Products $7.70 Arctic Office $7.70
Cascade School Supplies $8.70 Alt Products
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Letter - Green School Specialty $7.86
Staples $9.76 Alt
Brand |SMEAD #C15H, ESSELTE
ESS91525, BSN #17533,
SCHOOL SPECIALTY
070311
010279 |FOLDERS, FILE Arctic Office Products $21.99 Alt School Specialty  $10.19
Cascade School Supplies $8.75 Alt*
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Letter - Asst. Colors School Specialty $10.19
Staples $16.77 Alt
Brand |ESSELTE #R15213ASST,
SCHOOL SMART #1475805
010280 |FOLDERS, FILE Arctic Office Products $7.99 Alt Arctic Office $7.99
Cascade School Supplies $6.95 Alt * Products
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Letter - Manila School Specialty No Bid
Staples $9.33 Alt

Brand [OXFORD #ESS752-1/3M
SMEAD #153L,
UNIVERSAL #12113

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

where k|ds come first

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
(907) 714-8876

Bid #118-19

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}

Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted
010357 |GLUE STICK Arctic Office Products $2.658 Alt Pyramid School $1.21
Cascade School Supplies $1.80 Alt Products
ea National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products $1.21
Size -1.4 07, School Specialty No Bid
Staples $.94 Alt *
Brand |SCOTCH #6108-MEGA
010358 |GLUE STICK Arctic Office Products $.478 Cascade School $.39
Cascade School Supplies $.39 Supplies
ea National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 25 o7, School Specialty No Bid
Staples $.59
Brand |DIXON #15083, ELMERS
EPIE542, AVERY #00166
010360 |GLUE-ALL Arctic Office Products No Bid Cascade School $4.74
Cascade School Supplies $4.74 Supplies
pt National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
. . School Specialty No Bid
Size - Pint
'z ! Staples $1.81*
Brand |ELMERS #E1321
010361 |GLUE STICK Arctic Office Products $1.882 Alt Staples $.92
Cascade School Supplies $1.45
ea National Art & School Sup.  $1.12
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 75 oz. School Specialty No Bid
Staples $.92 Alt
Brand |OIC #50002, EBERHARD

UHU #99649

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Page 8 of 17
Purchasing Department B

139 E. Park Avenue RECAP
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
where k|ds come first - .
(907) 714-8876 Bid #118-19
Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}
010362 |GLUE, MULTI-PURPOSE  Arctic Office Products $1.89 Cascade School $1.19
Cascade School Supplies $1.19 Supplies
ea National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -4 oz, School Specialty No Bid
Staples $.53 Alt
Brand |ELMERS GLUE-ALL
1322NR
010369 [LABELS, ADDRESS Arctic Office Products $8.50 National Art & $7.60
Cascade School Supplies $34.97 School Supplies
box National Art & School Sup.  $7.60
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -1” x 2-5/8" School Specialty $29.84
Staples $17.10
Brand |AVERY PRES-A-PLY
30600, AVERY
DENNISON #5160
010383 |LAMINATING FILM Arctic Office Products $34.50 Pyramid School $22.95
Cascade School Supplies $71.33 Products
rll National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products $22.95
Size -25” X 500’ School Specialty No Bid
Staples $57.07
Brand |GBC #3000004
010387 [LAMINATING FILM Arctic Office Products $54.50 Pyramid School ~ $37.95
Cascade School Supplies No Bid Products
rll National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products $37.95
Size - 25" x 250’ School Specialty No Bid
Staples $70.10

Brand [GBC #3000024

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Page 9 of 1
Purchasing Department -

139 E. Park Avenue RECAP
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
where k|ds come first - .
(907) 714-8876 Bid #118-19
Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}
010389 |LAMINATING POUCHES  Arctic Office Products $19.99 Alt Cascade School $12.95
Cascade School Supplies $12.95 Alt Supplies
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -9"x 11.5"- 100 perbox ~ Scno0 Specialty $13.92
Staples $33.24 Alt
Brand |BLACK & DECKER #3-100,
SCHOOL SMART #086081
010390 |LAMINATING POUCHES  Arctic Office Products $49.79 Staples $38.68
Cascade School Supplies No Bid
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -9” X 11.5” - 50 per box School Specialty No Bid
Staples $38.68
Brand |[OREGON LAMINATION
LR10RC-1, FELLOWS
52042
010396 [MAT, CHAIR Arctic Office Products $51.82 Alt Staples $48.62
Cascade School Supplies No Bid
ea National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - 45" x 53" School Specialty No Bid
Staples $48.62 Alt
Brand |RUBBERMAID #40600
010406 |PAGE PROTECTORS Arctic Office Products $8.95 Alt School Specialty  $5.49
Cascade School Supplies No Bid
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -9.5" x 11" School Specialty $5.49
Staples $6.65

Brand [STAPLES #10524,
SCHOOL SPECIALTY
067506

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

where k|ds come first

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
(907) 714-8876

Page 10 of 17
RECAP

Bid #118-19

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}

Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted
010409 |MARKER, PERMANENT Arctic Office Products $6.40 National Art & $4.10
Cascade School Supplies $6.26 School Supply
set National Art & School Sup.  $4.10
Pyramid School Products $4.64 Sanford Min
Size -8 color set - Fine tip School Specialty No Bid
Staples $6.29
Brand |SANFORD #30078
010418 |PEN, BALLPOINT Arctic Office Products $6.60 Pyramid School $4.69
Cascade School Supplies $7.77 Products
doz National Art & School Sup.  $5.25
Pyramid School Products $4.69 Pentel Min
Size - Black School Specialty No Bid
Staples $7.80
Brand |PENTEL RSVP #BK90A
010419 |PEN, BALLPOINT Arctic Office Products $6.60 Pyramid School $4.69
Cascade School Supplies $7.77 Products
doz National Art & School Sup.  $5.25
Pyramid School Products $4.69 Pentel Min
Size -Blue School Specialty No Bid
Staples $7.80
Brand |PENTEL RSVP #BK90C
010420 |pEN, BALLPOINT Arctic Office Products $1.212 National Art & $.98
Cascade School Supplies $1.56 School Supplies
doz National Art & School Sup.  $.98
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Black School Specialty No Bid
Staples $2.40
Brand [BIC ROUND STIC
GSF11BK

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

where k|ds come first

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
(907) 714-8876

Page 11 of 17
RECAP

Bid #118-19

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}

Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted
010421 |PEN, BALLPOINT Arctic Office Products $1.26 National Art & $.98
Cascade School Supplies $1.56 School Supplies
doz National Art & School Sup.  $.98
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -Blue School Specialty No Bid
Staples $2.40
Brand |BIC ROUND STIC
GSF11BL
010422 |PEN, BALLPOINT Arctic Office Products $2.85 Staples $1.80
Cascade School Supplies $1.37 Alt
doz National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -Red School Specialty No Bid
Staples $1.80
Brand |BIC ROUND STIC
GSF11RD
010430 |MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER  Arctic Office Products $.499 National Art & $.36
Cascade School Supplies $.59 School Supplies
€a National Art & School Sup.  $.36
Pyramid School Products $.41 Sanford Min
Size - Chisel Tip - Fluorescent School Specialty No Bid
Yellow Staples $.57 Alt
Brand |SANFORD #25025,
STAPLES #167031
010433 |MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER  Arctic Office Products $.479 Alt School Specialty $.28
Cascade School Supplies $.61
€a National Art & School Sup.  $.36

Size - Chisel Tip - Pink

Brand [SCHOOL SPECIALTY
1354266, SANFORD
25009

Pyramid School Products
School Specialty
Staples

$.41 Sanford Min
$.28
$.57 Alt

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
(907) 714-8876

Page 12 of 17

RECAP

where k|ds come first

Bid #118-19

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}

Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted
010438 |MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER  Arctic Office Products $3.23 National Art & $2.34
Cascade School Supplies $3.14 Alt School Supplies
set National Art & School Sup.  $2.34
Pyramid School Products $2.09 Sanford Min
Size -5 color set School Specialty No Bid
Staples $2.72
Brand |SANFORD #27075
010439 |MARKER, DRY ERASE Arctic Office Products $.922 Alt National Art & $.63
Cascade School Supplies $1.08 School Supplies
EA National Art & School Sup.  $.63
Pyramid School Products $.72 Sanford Min
Size -Fine Ponit - Black School Specialty No Bid
Staples $1.00
Brand |SANFORD EXPO #86001
010440 |MARKER, DRY ERASE Arctic Office Products $.913 Alt National Art & $.70
Cascade School Supplies $1.25 School Supplies
ea National Art & School Sup.  $.70
Pyramid School Products $.81 Sanford Min
Size - Bullet-ip - Black School Specialty No Bid
Staples $.97
Brand |SANFORD EXPO #82001
010444 |MARKER, WASHABLE Arctic Office Products $3.96 Cascade School $2.45
Cascade School Supplies $2.45 Supplies
set National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -8 color set School Specialty No Bid
Staples $3.68 Alt

Brand [LIQUI MARK #21008,

PRANG #80680

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

where k|ds come first

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
(907) 714-8876

Page 13 of 17
RECAP

Bid #118-19

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}

Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted
010445 |MARKER, DRY ERASE Arctic Office Products $3.78 National Art & $2.46
Cascade School Supplies $4.68 School Supplies
set National Art & School Sup.  $2.46
Pyramid School Products $3.17 Sanford Min
Size - Chisel tip - 4 color set School Specialty No Bid
Staples $4.57
Brand [SANFORD EXPO #80074
OR AVERY #24-409
010446 |MARKER, PERMANENT Arctic Office Products $9.90 National Art & $5.88
Cascade School Supplies $9.54 School Supplies
doz National Art & School Sup.  $5.88
Pyramid School Products $7.08 Sanford Min
Size -Fine tip - 1.0mm - Black School Specialty No Bid
Staples $8.76
Brand [SANFORD SHARPIE
30001Dz
010458 |MARKER, WASHABLE Arctic Office Products $6.04 National Art & $3.30
Cascade School Supplies $6.02 School Supplies
set National Art & School Sup.  $3.30
Pyramid School Products $3.44
Size - Assorted Classic School Specialty No Bid
Staples $5.14
Brand |CRAYOLA #58-7812
010491 |PENCIL, COMPASS Arctic Office Products $.048 Arctic Office $.048
REFILLS Cascade School Supplies $.08 Alt Products
ea National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
Staples $.07 Alt
Brand [UNIVERSAL #UNV24264

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

where k|ds come first

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
(907) 714-8876

Page 14 of 17
RECAP

Bid #118-19

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}

Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted
010496 |PENCIL, WRITING Arctic Office Products $2.388 School Specialty $1.62
Cascade School Supplies $1.80
doz National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -#2 School Specialty $1.62
Staples $1.95 Alt
Brand |TICONDEROGA #13882
010502 |P|PE CLEANERS Arctic Office Products $1.80 Cascade School $1.35
Cascade School Supplies $1.35 Alt Supplies
pkg National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -12" School Specialty No Bid
Staples $1.88
Brand |CHENILLE KRAFT #7112-1,
BEMISS JASON #BJ2530-0
010510 |POST-|T NOTES (POP-UP) Arctic Office Products $5.95* Staples $7.52
Cascade School Supplies $14.12
doz National Art & School Sup.  $13.09
Pyramid School Products $11.59 3M Min
Size -3" x 3" - Neon School Specialty No Bid
Staples $7.52
Brand [3M CAPE TOWN
COLLECTION #R33012AN
010511 |PO$T-|T NOTES (POP-UP) Arctic Office Products $.496 Alt Arctic Office $.496
Cascade School Supplies $12.95 Products
€a National Art & School Sup.  $.85
Pyramid School Products $.88 3M Min
Size -3" x 3" - Canary Yellow School Specialty No Bid
Staples $1.00

Brand [POST-IT #R330-YW

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

where k|ds come first

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
(907) 714-8876

Page 15 of 17
RECAP

Bid #118-19

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}

Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted
010515 |POST-IT NOTES Arctic Office Products $3.18 Pyramid School $1.79
Cascade School Supplies $3.28 Products
doz National Art & School Sup.  $2.70
Pyramid School Products $1.79 3M Min
Size -3" x 3" - Canary Yellow School Specialty No Bid
Staples $11.23
Brand |HIGHLAND #6549YW, 3M
654
010522 |POST-IT NOTES (LINED) Arctic Office Products $.833 Arctic Office $.833
Cascade School Supplies $2.25 Products
pad National Art & School Sup.  $1.78
Pyramid School Products $1.73 3M Min
Size -4” x 6” - Canary Yellow School Specialty No Bid
Staples $1.12
Brand [3M #660
010524 |POST-IT NOTES (CUBE)  Arctic Office Products $6.90 Pyramid School $4.73
Cascade School Supplies $6.15 Products
pad National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products $4.73 3M Min
Size -3" x 3" - Blue Wave School Specialty No Bid
Staples $5.32
Brand [3M #2056RC
010532 [PUSH PINS, PLASTIC ~ Arctic Office Products $.98 Cascade School ~ $.57
Cascade School Supplies $.57 Alt Supplies
box National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size - Clear School Specialty $.91
Staples $2.00 Alt

Brand [SCHOOL SMART #003354,

OIC #92610

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
(907) 714-8876

Page 16 of 17

RECAP

where k|ds come first Bid #118-19

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}

Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted
010601 |RULER, METRIC Arctic Office Products $.85 Alt School Specialty  $.35
Cascade School Supplies $.42 Alt
ea National Art & School Sup.  No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -12” School Specialty $.35
Staples $.40
Brand |SCHOOL SMART #015348
010612 |SCISSORS, OFFICE Arctic Office Products $8.89 Cascade School $2.56
Cascade School Supplies $2.56 Alt Supplies
ea National Art & School Sup.  $5.90
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Size -8 School Specialty $6.48
Staples $2.80 Alt
Brand |FISKAR #FISK3452
010616 |SHARPENER, ELECTRIC Arctic Office Products $59.90 Pyramid School $39.95
Cascade School Supplies $24.57 Alt* Products
ea National Art & School Sup.  $48.90 Alt
Pyramid School Products $39.95
Size - Black with Gray Base School Specialty No Bid
Staples $33.12 Al
Brand |HUNT #HUN1645
010656 |TAPE, BOOK MENDING Arctic Office Products $8.89 Pyramid School $4.24
Cascade School Supplies $5.51 Products
rll National Art & School Sup.  $4.64
Pyramid School Products $4.24 3M Min
Size - Clear School Specialty No Bid
Staples $4.32

Brand [SCOTCH 3M #8452

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL
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where k|ds come first - .
(907) 714-8876 Bid #118-19
Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand}
010684 |TAPE, BOX SEALING Arctic Office Products $5.09 Alt Pyramid School $4.00
Cascade School Supplies $5.19 Products
rll National Art & School Sup.  $4.46
Pyramid School Products $4.00 3M Min
Size - Clear School Specialty No Bid
Staples $6.59
Brand |SCOTCH 3M #750RDCL
010690 |TAPE, MENDING Arctic Office Products $2.70 National Art & $1.60
Cascade School Supplies $2.54 School Supplies
rll National Art & School Sup.  $1.60
Pyramid School Products $2.04 3M Min
Size -3/4” x 1296" - Clear School Specialty No Bid
Staples $2.34

Brand [3M MAGIC #81034

* Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw / All or None = ALL



