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 RECAP - Revised

Bid #119-19

Item #

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876

#01 BOOKCASE (2 SHELF) Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$168.10
$165.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$180.71
$459.99

Capital Office $165.00

11.5"D x 36"W x 29.88"H -
Mahogony

Size -

Brand HON 1870 SERIES #H1871

ea

#02 BOOKCASE (6 SHELF) Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$357.00
$379.45 Alt
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$351.71
$529.99

School Specialty $351.71

11.5"D x 36"W x 84"H -
Mahogany

Size -

Brand HON 1870 SERIES #H1877

ea

#03 BOOKCASE (6 SHELF) Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

NO BID
NO BID
$529.60 Alt
NO BID
NO BID
$331.46
$629.99

School Specialty $331.46

36 W x 12 D x 84 H in -
Natural Oak

Size -

Brand NORSONS
CONTEMPORARY
VENEER #1362463

ea

#04 BOOKTRUCK Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

NO BID
$524.20
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$296.21 Alt
$184.99*

School Specialty $296.21

44-1/2" x 31" x 17" - BlueSize -

Brand DEMCO LIBRARY QUIET
#WH12187130

ea

    * Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw /  All or None = ALL
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Bid #119-19

Item #

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876

#05 CABINET, LOCKING
SUPPLY

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

NO BID
$675.44
NO BID
$613.77
NO BID
$325.46 Alt
$479.99 Alt

Lakeshore
Learning

$613.77

 33"w x 18"d x 37"h -
Natural

Size -

Brand FIRST STEPS #AA156

ea

#06 CHAIR, EXECUTIVE Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$199.00 Alt
$299.99
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$299.96 Alt
$289.99 ***

NO AWARD

ChestnutSize -

Brand SERTA WORKS
#SERT1245

ea

#07 CHAIR, EXECUTIVE Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$199.00 Alt
$299.99
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$299.96 Alt
$289.99 ***

NO AWARD

GraySize -

Brand SERTA WORKS
#SERT1245

ea

#08 CHAIR, STACKING Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$212.00 Alt
$88.89
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$65.21
$63.99 ***

School Specialty $65.21

37”H x 17-3/4”W x 22”D -
Black

Size -

Brand NATIONAL PUBLIC
SEATING #9300 SERIES
#9360-BT

ea

    * Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw /  All or None = ALL 



Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

Page  3  of 8

 RECAP - Revised

Bid #119-19

Item #

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876

#09 CHAIR, STACKING Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$36.50 Alt
$96.69
NO BID
$70.10
NO BID
$27.71 Alt
$54.99 Alt

Lakeshore
Learning

$70.10

13.5”H - TanSize -

Brand LAKESHORE LEARNING
#DG-513

ea

#10 CHAIR, STACKING Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$72.00 Alt
$62.61
$109.35 Alt
$73.79 Alt
$56.00 ALL
$27.71 Alt *
$82.25

School Outfitters $56.00

19”W x 18-3/4”D x 31-1/2”H
- Navy

Size -

Brand LEARNITURE SHAPES
SERIES #LNT-INM3018-SO

ea

#11 CHAIR, STACKING
GUEST

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$106.25
$108.54
$146.50 Alt
NO BID
NO BID
$160.46 Alt
$133.99

Arctic Office
Products

$106.25

BlackSize -

Brand HON BASYX VL506
#BSXVL508ES10

ea

#12 COUCH, LOVE SEAT Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$924.00
$756.67
$1552.75 Alt
NO BID
NO BID
$964.28
$706.99 ***

Capital Office $756.67

33.5”L x 58”W x 30.75”H  -
Black

Size -

Brand OFFICE STAR OSP
#SL8472

ea

    * Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw /  All or None = ALL
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Bid #119-19

Item #

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876

#13 DESK, ADJUSTABLE
STUDENT (HEXAGON
SHAPE)

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$165.00 Alt *
NO BID
NO BID
$404.67 Alt
NO BID
$301.89
$192.61 Alt *

School Specialty $301.89

21x16x33 x 30-43”H -
Fusion Maple (PP)

Size -

Brand CLASSROOM SELECT
#1495640

ea

#14 DESK, ADJUSTABLE
STUDENT (WEDGE
SHAPE)

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

NO BID
$359.85 Alt **
NO BID
$306.27 Alt *
NO BID
$382.69
$629.99

School Specialty $382.69

35” D x 50”W x 24”-34”HSize -

Brand PARAGON FURNITURE
A&D WEDGE #PAR-AND-
AH-WEDGE

ea

#15 DESK, HEIGHT
ADJUSTABLE
            STRAIGHT
FRONT DESK & RETURN

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$1970.00
$1566.76
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

Capital Office $1566.76

63"W x 84"D x 291⁄2 - 491⁄
4"H

Size -

Brand SAFCO MAYLINE MEDINA
#MNT52H

EA

    * Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw /  All or None = ALL 
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Bid #119-19

Item #

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876

#16 PEDESTAL, MOBILE Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$365.00
$224.60
NO BID
$273.67 Alt
NO BID
$458.88
$257.99 Alt

Capital Office $224.60

103⁄4"W x 23"D x 241⁄2"H -
Medina Gray Steel-LGS

Size -

Brand SAFCO SKINNY
PEDESTAL #ABSP

ea

#17 SEATING, FLOWER
SHAPE

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

NO BID
$2450-64
NO BID
NO BID
$2000.00 ALL
$2315.65 Alt
NO BID

School Outfitters $2000.00

Size -

Brand LEARNITURE SHAPES
SERIES II #LNT-1033-A
-7PK

ea

#18 SEATING, HEXAGON
SHAPE

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

NO BID
$520.98
NO BID
NO BID
$450.00 ALL
$315.83 Alt *
NO BID

School Outfitters $450.00

30.5”W x 34.5”D x 18”H -
Gray Crosshatch GY

Size -

Brand LEARNITURE SHAPES
SERIES II #LNT-1035-A

ea

#19 SHELVING Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

NO BID
$1049.14
NO BID
$613.77 Alt
NO BID
$376.47 Alt
NO BID

Capital Office $1049.14

60"H x 37"W x 12"DSize -

Brand GAYLOR AMERICANA
#P20479410

ea

    * Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw /  All or None = ALL 
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Bid #119-19

Item #

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876

#20 SHELVING, PICTURE
BOOK - SLOPED TOP

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

NO BID
$1200.85
NO BID
$367.77 Alt *
NO BID
$335.92 Alt *
NO BID

Capital Office $1200.85

42”H x 37”W x 12”DSize -

Brand GAYLORD AMERICANA
#P20460130

ea

#21 TABLE,  ADJUSTABLE 
(KIDNEY)

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$465.00 Alt
$477.50
$469.67 Alt
$429.27
NO BID
$328.20 Alt
$383.49 Alt

Lakeshore
Learning

$429.27

48” x 72’ - adjust 21” to 30”HSize -

Brand LAKESHORE LEARNING
#DG577

ea

#22 TABLE,  ADJUSTABLE
(RECTANGULAR)

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$278.00 Alt
$377.12
$369.03 Alt
$293.97
NO BID
$262.04 Alt
$247.99 Alt

Lakeshore
Learning

$293.97

30” x 60” - adjust 21” to 30”
H

Size -

Brand LAKESHORE LEARNING
#DG587

ea

#23 TABLE, ADJUSTABLE 
(HORSESHOE)

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$403.00 Alt
$360.25 Alt
NO BID
$441.57 Alt
NO BID
$372.99
NO BID

School Specialty $372.99

48” x 72” - adjust 15” to 25”
H - Gray Nebula

Size -

Brand CLASSROOM SELECT
#1457640

ea

    * Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw /  All or None = ALL 
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Bid #119-19

Item #

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876

#24 TABLE, ADJUSTABLE
(KITE SHAPED)

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$336.00
$292.56 Alt *
NO BID
$293.97 Alt *
NO BID
$349.76
NO BID

Arctic Office
Products

$336.00

24” x 40” - adjust 25” to 34”
H

Size -

Brand HON BUILD #HESA-244OE
-4L

ea

#25 TABLE, ADJUSTABLE
(ROUND)

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$265.00 Alt
$366.29
$349.57
$306.27
NO BID
$247.89 Alt
NO BID

Lakeshore
Learning

$306.27

42” Diameter - adjust 21” to
30”H

Size -

Brand LAKESHORE LEARNING
#DG579

ea

#26 TABLE, ADJUSTABLE
(SQUARE)

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office 
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning 
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

NO BID
$298.41
NO BID
$244.77
NO BID
$230.32 Alt
NO BID

Lakeshore
Learning

$244.77

30” x 30” - adjust 21” to 30”
H

Size -

Brand LAKESHORE LEARNING
#AA688

ea

#27 TABLE, MARKERBOARD
ACTIVITY (KIDNEY)

Arctic Office Products
Capital Office
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

NO BID
$477.50 Alt
NO BID
$601.47 Alt
NO BID
$375.03
NO BID

School Specialty $375.03

48” x 72” x 22-30”HSize -

Brand CLASSROOM SELECT
#1497097

ea

    * Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw /  All or None = ALL 
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Bid #119-19

Item #

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876

#28 TABLE, TRAINING Arctic Office Products
Capital Office
Cascade School Supplies
Lakeshore Learning
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Wayfair LLC

$410.00
$426.90
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

Arctic Office
Products

$410.00

18”W x 6”L - Salt/PepperSize -

Brand SOUTHERN ALUMINUM
ALULITE #SOU-A1860

EA

    * Does Not Meet Specifications / ** No Specificiations Provided / *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw /  All or None = ALL 


