
AWARD IN BOLD KPBSD Bid #129-19

RECAP

QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE PER UNIT 

MILK,  WHITE, 1% LOW FAT 

Smith Brother's COUNTRY FOODS $0.44

Darigold FSA - NO BID

or approved equal

MILK, WHITE, 1% LOW FAT 

Smith Brother's

Darigold COUNTRY FOODS $3.88 - 1/2 GALLON

or approved equal FSA - NO BID

Unflavored, US Grade A.                                                          

Fresh, pasturized, homogenized, maximum 2% 

butterfat content, to be fortified with Vitamin A (2000 

international units per quart), vitamin D (400 

international units per quart).                                                                                  

Must meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska 

and US Public Health Service regulations and 

codes.                      To be packaged in 1/2 pint, 

gable-top waxed or polyethylene-coated, non-

leaking paperboard cartons.

Unflavored, US Grade A.                                                       

Fresh, pasturized, homogenized, maximum 2% 

butterfat content, to be fortified with Vitamin A (2000 

international units per quart), vitamin D (400 

international units per quart).                                                                                 

Must meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska 

and US Public Health Service regulations and 

codes.                                             To be packaged 

in gallon or 1/2 gallon.

2000 CASE 50/half-pints/cs

62 CASE 4/gallon/cs
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AWARD IN BOLD KPBSD Bid #129-19

RECAP

QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE PER UNIT 

MILK,  CHOCOLATE, NON-FAT
Smith Brother's COUNTRY FOODS $0.45

Darigold FSA - NO BID

or approved equal

MILK,  CHOCOLATE, NON-FAT

Smith Brother's

Darigold COUNTRY FOODS $3.99 - 1/2 GALLON

or approved equal FSA - NO BID

Unflavored, US Grade A.                                                            

Fresh, pasturized, homogenized, maximum 2% 

butterfat content, to be fortified with Vitamin A (2000 

international units per quart), vitamin D (400 

international units per quart).                                                                                      

Must meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska 

and US Public Health Service regulations and 

codes.                          To be packaged in 1/2 pint, 

gable-top waxed or polyethylene-coated, non-

leaking paperboard cartons.

Unflavored, US Grade A.                                                       

Fresh, pasturized, homogenized, maximum 2% 

butterfat content, to be fortified with Vitamin A (2000 

international units per quart), vitamin D (400 

international units per quart).                                                                                 

Must meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska 

and US Public Health Service regulations and 

codes.                                             To be packaged 

in gallon or 1/2 gallon.

8000 CASE 50/half-pints/cs

600 CASE 4/gallon/cs
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AWARD IN BOLD KPBSD Bid #129-19

RECAP

QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE PER UNIT 

SOY MILK, PLAIN

Pacific Natural Foods #08311COUNTRY FOODS $0.95

or approved equal FSA - NO BID

SOUR CREAM, LITE

Darigold COUNTRY FOODS $10.99

or approved equal FSA - NO BID

100 CASE 18/8 oz/cs

25 EACH 5 lb

100% lactose and dairy free

US Grade A                                                                        

Fresh, fat (4.0% to 10%), milk solids non-fat 

stabilizer (0.6% to 1.0%).                                                                    

Must meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska 

and US Public Health Service regulations and 

codes.                              To be packaged in 5# 

round plastic container .
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AWARD IN BOLD KPBSD Bid #129-19

RECAP

QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE PER UNIT 

BUTTERMILK, 1% LOW FAT

Smith Brother's COUNTRY FOODS $1.99

Darigold FSA - NO BID

or approved equal

COTTAGE CHEESE, NON-FAT

Darigold COUNTRY FOODS $9.79

or approved equal FSA - NO BID

100 CASE 12/quart/cs

5 EACH 5 lb

Cultured from skim milk                                                       

Must meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska 

and US Public Health Service regulations and 

codes                 To be packaged in non-leaking 

carton

Made from Grade A milk and cream, salt, cultured 

whey.  Must meet or exceed all minimum State of 

Alaska and US Public Health Service regulations 

and codes                        To be packaged in 5# 

round plastic container
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AWARD IN BOLD KPBSD Bid #129-19

RECAP

QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE PER UNIT 

YOGURT, NON-FAT

Upstate Farms COUNTRY FOODS $0.48

Yami FSA - NO BID

Darigold

or approved equal

YOGURT, NON-FAT

Dannon/Mt. High

Darigold

Upstate Farms COUNTRY FOODS $4.99

or approved equal FSA - NO BID
25 EACH Quart

500 CASE 4 oz

Assorted fruit flavors                                                            

Grade A pastureized                                                      

Must meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska 

and US Public Health Service regulations and 

codes.                                                      To be 

packaged in non-leaking cartons

Plain                                                                              

Grade A pastureized                                                      

Must meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska 

and US Public Health Service regulations and 

codes.                                                      To be 

packaged in non-leaking cartons
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AWARD IN BOLD KPBSD Bid #129-19

RECAP

QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE PER UNIT 

MILK, LACTOSE-FREE, 1%

Lactaid COUNTRY FOODS $4.54

or approved equal FSA - NO BID

MILK, RICE

Rice Dream COUNTRY FOODS $5.96

or approved equal FSA - NO BID

1/2 Gallon

Ultra pastureized                                                                       

Must meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska 

and US Public Health Service regulations and 

codes.                                                                        

To be packaged in non-leaking cartons

100 EACH Quart

Plain, Gluten-free, Shelf stable                                  

Contains vitamin A, vitamin D, Calcium, vitamin 

B12                                                              Must 

meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska and 

US Public Health Service regulations and codes.                                                                          

To be packaged in non-leaking cartons

60 EACH
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AWARD IN BOLD KPBSD Bid #129-19

RECAP

QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE PER UNIT 

YOGURT, GREEK Dannon/Mt. High

or approved equal COUNTRY FOODS 4.99 - ALT.

 FSA - NO BID

CREAM CHEESE Kraft

or approved equal COUNTRY FOODS $8.99 - ALT.

 FSA - NO BID

FETA CHEESE Athenos COUNTRY FOODS $5.98

or approved equal FSA - NO BID

 25 EACH 12oz

Low-fat                                                                                               

Must meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska 

and US Public Health Service regulations and 

codes.                                                                          

To be packaged in non-leaking cartons

25 EACH Quart

Plain, non-fat                                                                          

Must meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska 

and US Public Health Service regulations and 

codes.                                                                            

To be packaged in non-leaking cartons

25 EACH 3#

Plain, low-fat                                                                                  

Must meet or exceed all minimum State of Alaska 

and US Public Health Service regulations and 

codes.                                                                          

To be packaged in non-leaking cartons
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