
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Re-Cap bid #106-18

Award in Bold

Complete Integrated Dell GCSIT Howard Technology Hypertec USA Inch Zones

Solutions LLC Solutions Solutions

Dell Latitude E5480 XCTO Laptop (165) $1,359.00 $1176.92 * 869.00$  1,473.00$    1,151.20$    1,197.00$   

Carry Case, Laptop $32.50 Alt $43.99 Alt * No Bid $43.00 Alt $11.00 Alt 15.30$        

AmazonBasics 

DVD Drive 28.90$       $47.99 * No Bid No Bid 25.50$         27.60$        

LG Electronics #GP65NB60 

Dell Latitude E5480 XCTO Laptop (30) No Bid $1216.34 * 966.00$  1,473.00$    1,151.20$    No Bid

MOBILE COMPUTING CART, UNMANAGED No Bid $1462.99 * No Bid 1,656.00$    1,786.00$    No Bid

ERGOTRON #XDDNX; Dell #210-AHPN

* Price does not include shipping


