Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #121-18 Recap - Football Uniforms

Award is in bold
* = Alternate

UNDER ARMOUR BRUINS JERSEY/STRIPE STYLE #UF029JM/S
Football Jersey - White

UNDER ARMOUR SPOTLIGHT PANT/STRIPE STYLE #UF017PM/S
Football Pant - White

UNDER ARMOUR BRUINS JERSEY/STRIPE STYLE #UF029JM/S
Football Jersey - Midnight Navy

UNDER ARMOUR SPOTLIGHT PANT/STRIPE STYLE #UF017PM/S
Football Pant - Midnight Navy

Bigger Faster

Stronger

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

BSN Sports

$123.50

$89.40

$123.50

$89.40

Eastbay Inc.

$113.00

$82.00

$113.00

$82.00

Kollegetown

Sports

$119.00

$86.50

$119.00

$86.50

Legacy

Sports

$96.69

$69.96

$96.69

$69.96

Team Sports

Planet

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

GTM

Sportwear

$24.75%

$22.50*

$24.75%

$22.50*

Riddell

$88.20*

$69.00*

$88.20*

$69.00*

NO AWARD

NO AWARD

NO AWARD

NO AWARD



