Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #125-18 Recap - Office Supplies
Award is in bold

* = Alternate Arctic Cubic
Office Products Group, Inc.
010012 BINDER, ROUND RING 1" Green $2.550 No Bid

WILSON JONES #WLJ36814GN

010024  BINDING COMBS 1/4" Black $0.044 * No Bid
GBC #4000020, STAPLES #449261

010025 BINDING COMBS 3/8" Black $0.052 * No Bid
GBC #4000044, STAPLES #449262, SCHOOL SMART #084377

010043  BOARD, DISPLAY (CARDBOARD) 36" x 48" White $8.080 No Bid
SCHOOL SMART #1464947, HUNT #730190

010059  BOOK POCKETS 4-1/2" X 3-1/4" Manila No Bid No Bid
KAPCO #068574
010090  CARDS, INDEX 3" x 5" Ruled White $0.560 No Bid

OXFORD #31, AMPAD #23300

010096  CARDS, INDEX 3" x 5" Blank White $0.570 No Bid
OXFORD #30, AMPAD #23301

010126  CLEANER, DRY ERASE BOARD 8 oz. $3.500 No Bid
SANFORD EXPO #81803

010158  CONTACT PAPER 18" x 60' $31.290 * No Bid
MAGIC COVER #750

Mardel National Art &
Inc. School Supplies

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$4.99 * No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

Pyramid

School Pro.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2.11

$39.90

School
Specialty

$3.08

$0.03 *

$0.04

$5.39

$0.06

$0.82 *

$0.87 *

$3.99

$20.58



010175

010200

010210

010225

010231

010237

010241

010242

010245

010260

CORRECTION TAPE Single Line White
TOMBOW MONO CORRECTION TAPE #TOM68620

DISPENSER, MENDING TAPE Black
3M #C-38

MARKER, DRY ERASE KIT 12 Marker Kit
SANFORD #80054

ENVELOPE, CLASP 7" x 10"
BUISNESS SOURCE #36662, STAPLES #233577

ENVELOPE, INTER-DEPARTMENT 10" x13"
QUALITY PARK #63563, WESTVACO #C0882,
SCHOOL SMART #085057

ENVELOPE, REGULAR 4-1/8" x 9.5" White
OXFORD #73213, STAPLES #187013

ERASER, WHITE BOARD 5.13” W x 1.25”H
SANFORD EXPO #81505

ERASER, ARROWHEAD PENCIL CAP Red
PAPERMATE #73015, STAPLES #167601

ERASER, RUBBER 2-5/16" x 13/16” x 7/16” - Medium
DIXON PINK CARNATION #38900

FASTENER, ROUND-HEAD BRASS %" shank, 8mm Head
CHARLES LEONARD #2R-BP

Arctic

Office Products

$2.090

$2.700

$21.000

$9.110

$0.390

$13.900 *

$2.300

$0.288 *

$2.940 *

$0.990 *

Cubic

Group, Inc.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Mardel

Inc.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3.49 *

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

National Art &
School Supplies

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.48

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Pyramid

School Pro.

No Bid

$2.04

$14.44

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.69

No Bid

$2.59

$1.10

School

Specialty

§2.55

$5.85

$20.55

$11.81 *

$0.26

$18.38 *

§2.35

$0.17

$3.70

$0.59 *



Arctic Cubic Mardel National Art & Pyramid School

Office Products Group, Inc. Inc. School Supplies School Pro. Specialty

010262 FASTENER, ROUND-HEAD BRASS 1” shank, 10mm head $2.200 * No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.60 $0.86
CHARLES LEONARD #4R-BP, SCHOOL SMART #059952

010263 FRAME, HANGING FILE FOLDER (DRAWER) $3.700 * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.33 *
27" Lx11.75” W x 9.25”H
SMEAD #64870 (STAPLES #811341), ESSELTE #94420

010267 FOLDERS, PORTFOLIOS Assorted Colors $9.990 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.38
OXFORD #57513

010360 GLUE-ALL (WHITE) Pint $4.690 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.63
ELMERS #E1321

010366 LABELS, SHIPPING 2-1/8" x 4" White $12.790 No Bid No Bid $12.40 $9.75 $13.99
DYMO #30323

010369 LABELS, ADDRESS 1” x 2-5/8” $8.350 $9.99 * No Bid No Bid $10.95 $9.13
AVERY PRES-A-PLY #30600, AVERY DENNISON #5160

010387 LAMINATING FILM 25”x 250’ 3 mil $44.500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.69 S44.56
GBC #3000024

010389 LAMINATING POUCHES : 9” x 11.5" 3 mil $12.990 * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.83
BLACK & DECKER #3-100, SCHOOL SMART #086081

010400 PAD, STAMP (FELT) Size #1 Black Ink $2.200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.65 *
CARTERS #122085

010406 PAGE (SHEET) PROTECTORS 8.5" x 11" $8.420 * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.78 *

STAPLES #10524



010410

010418

010420

010421

010426

010430

010440

010445

010458

010484

MARKER, PERMANENT ULTRA-FINE Black
SANFORD SHARPIE #37001

PEN, BALLPOINT Black
PENTEL R.S.V.P. #BK90A

PEN, BALLPOINT 0.8 mm Fine Point Black
BIC ROUND STIC #GSF11BK

PEN, BALLPOINT 0.8 mm Fine Point Blue
BIC ROUND STIC #GSF11BL

PEN, GEL 0.7 mm Medium Point Asst. 12/set
STAPLES #555124

MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER Chisel Tip Fluorescent Yellow
SANFORD #25025, STAPLES #167031

MARKER, DRY ERASE Bullet-tip Black
SANFORD EXPO #82001

MARKER, DRY ERASE Chisel-tip — 4 per set
SANFORD EXPO #80074 OR AVERY #24-409

MARKER, WASHABLE Broadline Assorted Classic
CRAYOLA #58-7812

LEAD, MECHANICAL PENCIL 0.5mm — 12 per tube
PENTEL #C505-HB

Arctic

Office Products

$9.240

$5.844

$1.080

$1.080

No Bid

$0.416

$1.200

$3.590

$5.290

$0.530

Cubic

Group, Inc.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Mardel

Inc.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

National Art &

School Supplies

$6.48

$5.40

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.73

$2.48

$3.40

No Bid

Pyramid

School Pro.

$7.08

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.41

$0.83

$3.17

No Bid

No Bid

School

Specialty

$10.99

$6.95

$1.46

$1.46

$10.11 *

$0.58

$1.17

$5.11

$5.22

No Bid



010487

010532

010584

010609

010633

010680

012060

PENCIL, MECHANICAL 0.7mm Lead Size
PENTEL SHARPLET-2 #A127C

PUSH PINS, PLASTIC Clear
SCHOOL SMART #003354

RUBBERBANDS No. 16, 2.5”L x 1/16” W — % |b. bag
ALLIANCE ADVANTAGE #020859

SCISSORS 5" Sharp Tip
ACME #240S-5

STAPLES, STANDARD
SWINGLINE #35108

TAPE, MASKING 3/4" x 60 yds
3M 23434

NAME TAGS (STUDENT)2-1/2" x 3"
TREND SHINY RED APPLE TERRIFIC LABLES #T-68080

Arctic
Office Products

$1.666

$0.890 *

$1.390 *

$1.720 *

$0.890 *

$6.900

No Bid

Cubic

Group, Inc.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Mardel

Inc.

No Bid

$1.99 *

No Bid

$2.49 *

No Bid

No Bid

$3.99 *

National Art &
School Supplies

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$5.88

No Bid

Pyramid

School Pro.

No Bid

$0.99

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$4.51

No Bid

School

Specialty

$3.26

$0.78

$1.35

$1.02 *

$1.03 *

$5.99

$3.88 *



