Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap
= PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
#*
Beans, Baked, Maple, Canned Bush's #1619 FSA 38.59
or approved equal
100 | 168 | CASE | 611180z pp =
Beans, Refried, Canned. Rosarita #4430010641 FSA 49.36
or approved equal No Award
101 56 CASE | 6/1120z
Cereal, Honey Nut Chex, Bowlpak, Gluten-Free. Product must | General Mills #11866000 FSA 24.72
provide 1 oz equivalent grains per serving.
or approved equal
102 50 CASE | 96/1.13 0z
Cereal, Cinnamon Toast Crunch, Bowlpak, Reduced Sugar. General Mills #29444000 FSA 24.21
Product must provide 1 oz equivalent grains per serving.
or approved equal
103 | 140 | CASE | 96/10z
Cereal, Cocoa Puffs, Whole Grain, Bowlpak, Reduced Sugar. General Mills #31888000 FSA 24.19
Product must provide 1 0z equivalent grains per serving.
or approved equal
104 | 100 | CASE | 96/1.06 oz




Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap

= PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
#*
Cereal, Frosted Mini Wheats Little Bites, Chocolate, Whole Grain, Kellogg's #3800045861 FSA 28.44
Bowlpak. Product must provide 1 o0z equivalent grains per
serving. or approved equal
105 | 120 | CASE | 96/10z
Chips, Tortilla, Triangle, Ready to eat. WG Mission #8619 FSA 20.90
or approved equal
106 85 CASE 6/2#
Pineapple Chunks, Canned, Packed in unsweetened syrup or  |pole #38900-00468-9
pineapple juice, USDA Grade A. :
Festival
107 | 100 | CASE 6/#10 Signature FSA 37.76
Dole #00553
or approved equal
Orange, Mandarin Segments in Light Syrup. Festival #475100
or approved equal
108 | 200 | CASE | 6/#10 =
Signature alt FSA 44.32
No Award
Gravy Mix, Chicken, Instant, No MSG, Low Sodium.
Diamond Crystal #57773 FSA 21.25
109 | 20 | CASE| 8/150z Custom Culinary #17409CPANZ
Signature
or approved equal




Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap
= PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
#*
Gravy Mix, Beef, Instant, No MSG, Low Sodium. Diamond Crystal #57774 FSA 17.46
Signature #4610-816-SGN
110 | 20 | CASE| 8/14o0z or approved equal
Ketchup, Portion Control Packets, Low Sodium, USDA Grade A. |Heinz #78000108 FSA 16.95
Red Gold #REDYL9G
111 | 120 | CASE | 1000/9g or approved equal
Ketchup, Dispenser Pouch Pack, Low Sodium. Heinz #76003605 FSA 22.90
or approved equal
12| 80 |CASE| 2/5gal pprover e
Nature Valley Backpacker, Chewy Oatmeal Bites, S'mores General Mills #47296000 FSA 17.63
or approved equal
113 | 320 | CASE | 36/1.24 oz
Mayonnaise, Portion Control, Reduced Fat, 12g. Heinz #78000712 FSA 11.60
Portion Pac
114 60 CASE | 200/12g Signature
or approved equal




Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap

PRICE PER CASE FOB

QTY UNIT | PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA

# IN3LI

Mayonnaise, Reduced Fat, One gallon, Light Mayonnaise Kraft #2100064301 FSA 36.95

Nalley's #501033
115 8 CASE 4/1gal Signature

or approved equal

Mayonnaise, Light, Packaged in bucket or carton. Nalley's #41321-01031

Sig 3 Star #58301

116 45 TUB 30# Ventura #77031VEN

or approved equal

Sig #13831 alt FSA 27.75
No Award

Mustard, Portion Control, Yellow, Prepared.

French's #41500-85398

117 | 100 | CASE | 200/ea PPI #78000357 FSA 3.22

or approved equal

Sauce, Sweet & Sour Sauce, Portion Pack. Eastern Sun/Heinz #78000825  [FSA 8.25

or approved equal

118 | 15 | CASE | 500/ea

Pickles, Dill, Banquet, Sliced, Crinkle Cut, Pouch Pack. Heinz #658200 FSA 27.64

Heinz #75991013

119 | 25 | CASE| 6/5.75# or approved equal




Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap
= PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
#
Annie's Bunny Grahams Friends, Smart Snack. Product must General Mills #600237000 FSA 33.20
provide 1 0z equivalent grains per serving.
or approved equal
120 | 180 | CASE |100/1.25 0z
Juice, Fruitables, Gold Rush, 100% Juice. Product must provide Apple & Eve #24019 FSA 1117
1/2 cup vegetable per serving.
or approved equal
121 | 448 | CASE | 40/4.230z
Potatoes, Instant, Dehydrated Simplot #10071179022770 FSA 51.63
or approved equal
122| 70 | CASE| 121260z ppropece
Salsa, Low Sodium, Mild, Green Chile Salsa, Gallon, Plastic Jug |Rrosarita #4430010688
Only.
y or approved equal
123 | 20 | CASE 4/1gal RedGold #redsc99 alt FSA 34.99
No Award
Sauce, BBQ, Gallon. Heinz #0-13000-53950
Branding Iron #57414
124 10 CASE 4/1gal Heinz #74000017 FSA 44.07
Nalley's #280578 No Award
or approved equal




Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap
= PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
#*
Sauce, Marinara, Canned, Nutritionally Enhanced. Red Pack #RPKNAYE FSA 37.31
Heinz 75991016
125 56 CASE 6/#10 Angela Mia #2700039125
or approved equal
Syrup Cup, Portion Control, Low-Sugar, 1.1 0z Cary's #0071603712 FSA 19.69
or approved equal No Award
126 | 150 | CASE | 100/1.1 oz aibliAs
Juice, Fruitables, Tropical Twist, 100% Juice. Product must Apple & Eve #76301-84529TPF  [FSA 13.60
provide 1/2 cup vegetable per CN label
or approved equal
127 | 336 | CASE | 36/6.75 0z
Juice, Lemon, Bottle. ReaLemon #58223 FSA 24.45
or approved equal
128 15 EACH 320z
Gelatin Mix, Cherry. No Known QTY. Diamond Crystal #53638 No Bid
or approved equal
129 0 CASE | 12/240z




Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap
= PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
#
Sloppy Joe Sauce. Manwich #44181 FSA 36.30
or approved equal
130 | 40 | CASE 4#10
Ravioli, Beef, Canned. Product must provide 20z MIMA and 3/8 | cpef Boyardee #6414481080 FSA 59.87
cup Vegetable per CN label. | I
or approved equa
131 | 112 | CASE | 6/108 0z ilkale
Tomatoes, Diced in Juice, Canned Angela Mia #2700037854 FSA 26.11
S&W Tri Valley
132 | 56 | CASE 6/#10 or approved equal
Parsley Flakes. Culinary Origin #10988 FSA 15.78
Signature
133 6 EACH 100z or approved equal No Award
Green Beans, Cut, Reduced Sodium. No Known QTY. Allen's #1224 No Bid
Signature #731951
134 0 CASE 6/#10 or approved equal




Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap
= PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
#
Mixed Fruit Cocktail, Canned, Light Syrup. No Known QTY. NFG #600522 No Bid
or approved equal
135| 0 |CASE| 610 ket
Pears, Diced, Canned, Light Syrup. No Known QTY. Festival #739815 No Bid
Signature
136 0 CASE 6/#10 or approved equal
Tomato Paste, Canned Red Gold #REDUA99 FSA 39.77
or approved equal
137 56 CASE 6/#10
Tomato Sauce, Canned Hunts #104361
S&W #192118
138 | 56 | CASE 6/#10 or approved equal
Redgold #RPKA99 alt FSA 25.26
Corn, Canned, Reduced Sodium. No Known QTY. Seneca #54372 No Bid
Del Monte
139 0 CASE 6/#10 or approved equal




Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap
= PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
#
Beans, Black. No Known QTY. Bush's #001885 No Bid
Signature
140 0 CASE 6/#10 or approved equal
Spice, Basil Leaves. Culinary Secret #2005163 FSA 4.21
Oregon Spice
141 18 | EACH 550z or approved equal
Spice, Chili Powder Mild. Culinary Secret #2005180 FSA 5.79
Oregon Spice
142 24 | EACH 18 0z or approved equal
Spice, Cumin Powder, Ground. Culinary Secret #2005193 FSA 7.26
Oregon Spice
143| 12 |EACH| 150z uis
or approved equal
Spice, Mrs. Dash, No MSG, Gluten Free. Mrs Dash #J016-AY900 FSA 6.11
or approved equal
144 15 | EACH| 6.750z




Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap
= PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
#
Spice, Garlic Powder. Culinary Secret #2005204 FSA 9.15
or approved equal
145 | 30 | EACH 210z
Spice, Onion Flakes, Chopped, Dehydrated. Culinary Secret #2005227 FSA 12.21
or approved equal
146 | 25 | EACH 3#
Spice, Black Pepper. Culinary Secret #2005257 FSA 10.00
or approved equal
147 6 EACH 18 0z
Seasoning, talian, Bulk Culinary Secret #2005215 FSA 17.52
or approved equal
48| 6 |EACH| 280z A
Spice, Dill Weed, Dry Culinary Origin #341839 FSA 7.40
Pacific Spice
149 6 EACH 6oz or approved equal




Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap
= PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
*
Spice, Marjoram Leaves, Dry Culinary Origin #2005219 FSA 4.65
Pacific Spice
150 6 EACH 50z or approved equal
Spice, Salt, lodized. Morton #F110530001G FSA 24.89
or approved equal
151 | 1 | CASE| 24/260z aibliAs
Spice, Thyme Leaves Culinary Origin #343087 FSA 5.19
Signature #560316
152 1 CASE 90z or approved equal No Award
Spice, Oregano Leaves Culinary Origin #342307 FSA 4.7
Signature #559652
153 1 CASE 24 0z or approved equal
Tortilla Bowl, Edibowls, Edible-Bowl, Whole Grain, 4.5", Provides |1y, Natural Foods #0507-8 FSA 40.47
10z grain equivalent per bowl.
or approved equal
154 | 80 | CASE | 144/ea




Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap
= PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
#*
Dressing Mix, ltalian Good Season #4300084606
Kraft/Heinz #10043000846060 FSA 47.67
155| 24 PKG | 12/7.60z or approved equal
Rice, Whole Grain Parboiled Brown Rice. Uncle Ben's #12111 FSA 33.89
or approved equal
156 25 BAG 254
Jelly, Grape, Low-Sugar, Portion Control. Smucker's #5150000764 FSA 19.87
or approved equal
157 25 CASE | 200/0.50z
Dressing Mix, Ranch, No MSG. No Known QTY. Foothill Farms #V402-60190 No Bid
or approved equal
158 | 0 |cAsE| 10# aahiadat
Oil, Canola, Gallon. Chef's Pride #58501CHP FSA 39.56
or approved equal
159 10 CASE 3Mgal




Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap
= PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
#*
Pan Coating Spray, Canola. PAM #6414407263
Gold-n-Sweet #79531GNS
160 5 CASE | 6/170z Vegelene FSA 20.67
or approved equal
Cinnamon Toast Crunch Cereal Bar. Product Must Provide 10z | General Mills #100-16000-45576-1 |FSA 29.97
Equivalent Grains Per Serving.
or approved equal
161 60 CASE | 96/1.420z
Cocoa Puffs Cereal Bar. Product Must Provide 10z Equivalent General Mills #100-16000-45577-8 |FSA 23.02
Grains Per Serving. ; I
or approved equa
162 | 60 | CASE | 96/1.420z P
Rice Crispy Treats, 51% Whole Grain, Smart Snack Approved. | g J/Goodyman #9430
or approved equal
163 | 50 | CASE | 100/0.80z General Mill #160004557 alt FSA 29.28
No Award
Cheese Sauce, Cheddar. Product Must Provide 1oz MIMA per || and o Lakes #39940 FSA 74.11
serving.
or approved equal
164 56 CASE | 6/1060z

13



Award in Bold DRY FOOD PRODUCTS
Bid #127-18 Recap
o] PRICE PER CASE FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS SOLDOTNA
#*
Teriyaki Sauce, Bottle, Low Sodium Nippon Shokken #00000003
or approved equal
165 30 BTL 4.94% Kikkoman #651954 alt FSA 42.47
No Award
Sesame Dressing, Bottle, Low Sodium Nippon Shokken #00000193
or approved equal
166 25 BTL 60 oz Madrona #30024 Alt FSA 54.77
No Award
Sriracha Sauce, Portion Control, 7-gram packets. Red Gold #HUYHW7GC500 FSA 25.96
or approved equal
167 25 CASE 500/7g
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