
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Bid #102-19 Recap - Laptops, Desktops, Monitors & Charging Carts

Award is in bold

*=Alternate

CDI Computer Dell GCSIT Mericdian Zones LLC

Dealers Inc. Technologies Solutions Systems Inc.

Dell Latitude 5490 $870.00* $1,307.80 $919.00 $1,461.00 $1,279.61  

XCTO Laptop Computers

 

Dell Optiplex 5060 No Bid $857.40 $580.00 $984.00 $838.91

SFF  Desktop

 

Dell 22-P2217H Flat Panel Monitor No Bid $174.79 $139.00 $193.00 $171.81

 

Cabinet, Charging No Bid $548.79 No Bid $1,016.00 $622.09

16-Bay

 


