
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Bid #105-19 Recap - Office Supplies

Award is in bold

Cengage National Art Pyramid School

Learning Group & School Supplies Products School Specialty

#010012 WILSON JONES #WLJ36814GN  NO BID NO BID $1.35* $2.04 Alt

Round Ring Binder

#010025 GBC #4000044, STAPLES #449262, SCHOOL SMART #084377 NO BID NO BID $.05* $0.04

Binding Combs 3/8"  

#010026 GBC #4000068, FELLOWS 52326  NO BID NO BID $.07* $0.05

Binding Combs 1/2"

#010043 SCHOOL SMART #1464947 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.39

Board, Display (Cardboard)

#010056 CHARLES LEONARD #R-29, OIC #OIC99701 NO BID NO BID $.05 Alt $.08 Alt

Book Rings 1"

#010090 OXFORD #31, AMPAD #23300 NO BID NO BID NO BID $.38 Alt

Cards, Index 3" x 5" Ruled

#010096 OXFORD #30 NO BID NO BID NO BID $.55 Alt

Cards, Index 3" x 5" Blank

#010147 STAPLES #395200 NO BID NO BID $.69 Alt $.65 Alt

Clip, Binder 1-1/4"

#010149 OIC #99911, STAPLES 472480 NO BID NO BID $.30 Alt $.27 Alt

Clip, Paper #1 (regular)
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#010175 TOMBOW MONO CORRECTION TAPE #TOM68620 NO BID NO BID $2.09 $3.33

Correction Tape

#010200 3M #C-38  Dispenser, Mending Tape NO BID NO BID $2.04** $4.24

#010225 BUISNESS SOURCE #36662, STAPLES #233577 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.99 Alt

Envelope, Clasp 7"x 10"

#010227 BUSINESS SOURCE #36665 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.94 Alt

Envelope, Clasp 10" x 13"

#010236 BUSINESS SOURCE #42250 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.77 Alt NO AWARD

Envelpe, Regular #10 Business

#010242 PAPERMATE #73015, STAPLES #167601 NO BID NO BID $0.31 $0.17 Alt

Eraser, Arrowhead Pencil Cap

#010267 OXFORD #57513 Folders, Portfolios NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.49

#010354 ELMERS #364 Glue, Gel NO BID NO BID $1.01**** $1.72

#010357 SCOTCH #6108-MEGA NO BID NO BID $1.19** NO BID

Glue Stick

#010359 ELMERS KRAZY GLUE #EPIKG58548R NO BID NO BID $.90**** $1.87

Glue, Super

#010369 AVERY PRES-A-PLY #30600, AVERY DENNISON #5160 NO BID $8.20 $9.95 $7.51

Labels, Address
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#010383 GBC #3000004 NO BID NO BID $17.95* $25.03 Alt

Laminating Film 25" x 500'

#010388 C-LINE #65001 NO BID NO BID NO BID $36.52 Alt NO AWARD

Laminating Sheets, Heavy Weight

#010389 BLACK & DECKER #3-100, SCHOOL SMART #086081 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.83

Laminating Pouches

#010410 SANFORD SHARPIE #37001 NO BID $6.30 $7.08*** $8.11

Marker, Permanent Ultra-Fine Black

#010420 BIC ROUND STIC #GSF11BK NO BID NO BID $1.79 $1.81

Pen, Ballpoint Black

#010430 SANFORD #25025, STAPLES #167031 NO BID $0.44 $.41*** $0.85

Marker, Highlighter Fluorescent Yellow

#010431 SANFORD #25026, SCHOOL SMART #1354269 NO BID $0.44 $.41*** $0.28

Marker, Highlighter Fluorescent Green

#010435 STAPLES DURAMARK #167056 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.25 Alt NO AWARD

Marker, Permanent Chisel Tip Black

#010439 SANFORD EXPO #86001 NO BID $0.65 $.72*** $1.42

Marker, Dry Erase Fine Point Black

#010440 SANFORD EXPO #82001 NO BID $0.78 $.83*** $1.38

Marker, Dry Erase Bullet-tip Black

#010442 SANFORD EXPO #84074, DIXON #93040 NO BID $2.40 $2.69*** Alt $4.99

Marker, Dry Erase (set of 4 colors)
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#010443 SANFORD EXPO #16074 NO BID $2.80 $3.32*** $5.11

Marker, Overhead Projector (set of 4 colors)

#010445 SANFORD EXPO #80074 OR AVERY #24-409 NO BID $2.84 $3.17*** $4.99

Marker, Dry Erase (set of 4 colors)

#010446 SANFORD SHARPIE #30001DZ NO BID $5.94 $7.08*** $14.73

Marker, Permanent Fine Point Black

#010458 CRAYOLA #58-7812 NO BID $3.36 $4.95 $7.53

Marker, Washable Broad Line Asst Classic

#010472 MMF #258-0256-04 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Refill Pen, Stay-Put Counter Black

#010487 PENTEL SHARPLET-2 #A127C NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.50

Pencil, Mechanical

#010491 UNIVERSAL #UNV24264 NO BID NO BID NO BID $.04 Alt

Pencil, Compass Refills

#010508 POST-IT #65412SSAN NO BID $14.40 $11.29** $23.48 Alt

Post-It Notes 3" x 3" Marrakesh Collection

#010511 POST-IT #R330-YW NO BID $0.80 $.83** $1.73 NO AWARD

Post-It Notes 3" x 3" Canary Yellow

#010532 SCHOOL SMART #003354, OIC #92610 NO BID NO BID $0.79 Alt $0.78

Push Pins, Plastic Clear

#010584 ALLIANCE ADVANTAGE #020859 NO BID NO BID $0.95 Alt $1.35

Rubberbands No. 16, 2.5”L x 1/16” W – ¼ lb. bag
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#010585 UNIVERSAL #00454 NO BID NO BID $0.95 Alt $1.45 Alt

Rubberbands Size: 54 Assorted lengths

#010601 SCHOOL SMART #015348 NO BID NO BID $.25 Alt $0.29

Ruler 12"

#010602 SCHOOL SMART #081901 NO BID NO BID $3.99 Alt $1.11

Meter Stick

#010610 FISKAR #9416 Scissors, Blunt Tip Kid 5" NO BID $1.60 $2.29 $2.11

#010612 FISKAR #FISK3452  Scissors, Office 8" NO BID $5.96 $6.19 $9.03

#010616 HUNT #HUN1645 NO BID $37.50 $37.57**** NO BID

Sharpener, Electric Pencil Deluxe Heavy Duty

#010617 BOSTITCH SUPER PRO 6 #EPS12HC NO BID $62.40 $45.72***** $84.34

Sharpener, Electric Pencil Commercial

#010631 SWINGLINE #74701 NO BID $8.45 $8.42* $16.52

Stapler, Desk Full Size Black

#010633 SWINGLINE #35108 NO BID NO BID $.58* $0.69

Staples, Standard 1/4"

#010656 SCOTCH 3M #8452 NO BID $4.40 $3.96** $6.86

Tape, Book Mending 3" Clear

#010658 SCOTCH 3M #652 NO BID NO BID $1.78** NO BID

Tape, Correction White 1/3" x 700"
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#010680 SCOTCH 3M #23434 NO BID $5.17 NO BID $5.22

Tape, Masking

#010684 SCOTCH 3M #750RDCL NO BID $4.78 $3.84** $6.54

Tape, Box Sealing Clear

#010686 SCOTCH 3M #110 NO BID $2.10 $1.78** $3.09

Tape, Double Sided Foam

#010739 STAPLES #812286 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tray, Stackable Desk Smoke

#010745 3M #MMM7220 Wall Mounting Tabs NO BID NO BID $1.79** $3.10

#0102080 SCHOOL SMART #006465 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.85

Sentence Strips

Minnimum order

Totals by Mfg

* = $1300.00

** = $1500.00

*** = $1100.00

**** = $900.00

***** = $1090.00
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