
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Bid #110-19 Recap - Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

Award is in bold

Alaska Waste Moore & Moore 

Services

SITE AREA "A" Unit Price Unit Price

1. Dumpster Pick-up, 2-yard $71.60 No Bid

2. Rental Fee, 2-yard Dumpster $22.11 No Bid

3. Dumpster Pick-up, 4-yard $94.04 No Bid

4. Rental Fee, 4-yard Dumpster $41.45 No Bid

5. Dumpster Pickup, 4-yard Recycle $89.20 No Bid

6. Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard $113.98 No Bid

7. Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster $52.52 No Bid

8. Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard $109.01 No Bid

9. Rental Fee, 8-yard Dumpster $68.70 No Bid

10. Roll-off Box Pick-up, 30-yard $309.90 No Bid

11. Rental Fee, 30-yard Roll-off Box $207.90 No Bid

12. Roll-off Box Pick-up, 40-yard $309.90 No Bid

13. Sanitize Containers (price per cleaning)

a. 2-yard Dumpster $5.00 No Bid

b. 4-yard Dumpster $5.00 No Bid

c. 6-yard Dumpster $5.00 No Bid

d. 8-yard Dumpster $5.00 No Bid

e. 30-yard Roll-off Box $5.00 No Bid

f. 40-yard Roll-off Box $5.00 No Bid

SITE AREA "B" Unit Price Unit Price

1. Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard 552.33 No Bid

2. Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster $51.57 No Bid
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SITE AREA "B" continued…. Unit Price Unit Price

3. Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard $762.81 No Bid

4. Rental Fee, Pick-up, 8-yard Dumpster $68.70 No Bid

5. Sanitize Containers (price per cleaning)

a. 6-yard Dumpster $100.00 No Bid

b. 8-yard Dumpster $100.00 No Bid

SITE AREA "C" Unit Price Unit Price

1. Dumpster Pick-up, 2-yard $23.37 $10.00

2. Rental Fee, 2-yard Dumpster $18.80 $16.00

3. Dumpster Pick-up, 4-yard $46.84 $12.00

4. Rental Fee, 4-yard Dumpster $35.25 $32.00

5. Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard $70.21 $14.00

6. Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster $44.65 $48.00

7. Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard $93.67 $50.00

8. Rental Fee, 8-yard Dumpster $68.70 $50.00

9. Roll-off Box Pick-up, 40-yard $206.98 $100.00

10. Sanitize Containers (price per cleaning)

a. 2-yard Dumpster $5.00 $0.00

b. 4-yard Dumpster $5.00 $0.00

c. 6-yard Dumpster $5.00 $0.00

d. 8-yard Dumpster $5.00 $0.00

e. 40-yard Roll-off Box $5.00 $0.00

Price to replace broken dumpster lids, upon request:

Unit Price Unit Price

1. 2-yard Dumpster $75.00 $157.50

2. 4-yard Dumpster $75.00 $183.75

3. 6-yard Dumpster $75.00 $194.25

4. 8-yard Dumpster $75.00 $262.50

5. 30-yard Roll-off Box $0.00 $892.50

6. 40-yard Roll-off Box $0.00 $892.50

Bid 110-19

2 of 2


