
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Bid #114-19 Recap - Technology Equipment REVISED 4-16-19

Award is in bold

Dell Computer GCSIT Hypertec USA

 

Dell Latitude 5490 $1,305.93 $889.00 $1,150.95

XCTO Laptop

 

Dell Latitude 3380 $808.87 $565.00 $750.68

128GB XCTO Laptop  

Dell Latitude 3380 $873.87 $605.00 $796.30

256GB XCTO Laptop

Dell OptiPlex 5060 $831.40 $580.00 $738.93

SFF Desktop

Dell PowerEdge T640 $6,769.78 $6,032.00 $6,903.85

Server

Dell Dock $199.79 $155.00 $194.87

Dell Adapter $19.23 $15.75 $16.41

Dell Chromebook 11 $249.33 No Bid $294.87

3180 BTX - Touch

Google Chrome OS $26.00 No Bid $24.30

Management Console License

Education

Cart, Charging $2,104.10 No Bid $1,500.80

36-bay

Cart, Charging $624.04 No Bid $757.49

16-bay

Hewlett Packard OfficeJet 5255 No Bid No Bid $92.08

All-In-One Printer

External CD DVD Drive $43.49 No Bid $31.49

* - could not honor price


