Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #100-20 Recap - Paper

Award is in bold

* = Alternate

Arctic Office Cascade School

Supplies

#020956 COVERSTOCK - PASTEL PEACH $15.18 No Bid
SPRINGHILL VELLUM BRISTOL #58000, WAUSAU VELLUM
BRISTOL #82451, NEENAH VELLUM BRISTOL #82451

#021016 COVERSTOCK - CELESTIAL BLUE $22.90 No Bid
NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #22861, WAUSAU ASTROBRIGHT #22861,
RIVERSIDE KALEIDOSCOPE #02059 (MARINE BLUE)

#021019 COVERSTOCK - PULSAR PINK $22.90 No Bid
NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #21041, WAUSAU #22821

#021022 COVERSTOCK - LIFT-OFF LEMON $22.90 No Bid
NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #21021, WAUSAU ASTROBRIGHT #22831

#021023 COVERSTOCK - GAMMA GREEN $22.90 No Bid
NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #22741

#021025 COVERSTOCK - COSMIC ORANGE $22.90 No Bid
NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #22851

#021028 COVERSTOCK - WHITE $11.98 Alt No Bid
NEENAH EXACT VELLUM #82211, DOMTAR #81036
SPRINGHILL VELLUM #16000

#021032 TEXT PAPER - COSMIC ORANGE $11.64 No Bid

NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #22651, RIVERSIDE KALEIDOSCOPE #2218,
WAUSAU ASTROBRIGHT #22651
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Domtar

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

School
Specialty

$16.92

$39.02

$39.02

$39.02

$39.02

$39.02

$39.02 Alt

$19.79

S&S

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Veritiv

$11.99

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

WCP
Solutions

$12.28

$17.56

$17.56

$17.56

$17.56

$17.56

$11.34 Alt

$17.73



Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #100-20 Recap - Paper

Award is in bold

* = Alternate

#021036

#021067

#021109

#021130

#021132

#021134

#021135

#021136

#021137
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Arctic Office Cascade School

Supplies
TEXT PAPER - ROCKET RED $11.64 No Bid
NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT #22641, WAUSAU ASTROBRIGHT #22641
EASEL PAD 25 X 30.5 $19.75 $25.73
3M POST-IT #559 only
BUTCHER PAPER - FLAME RED No Bid $87.33 Alt
PACON ARTKRAFT #67031
CONSTRUCTION PAPER - BLACK 12 X 18 $4.25 $4.57
PACON TRU-RAY #103061, PACON PEACOCK #P6312
CONSTRUCTION PAPER - TURQUOISE 12 X 18 $4.25 $4.57
PACON TRU-RAY #103039, PACON PEACOCK #P7712
CONSTRUCTION PAPER - FESTIVE GREEEN (HOLIDAY) 12 X 18 $4.65 $4.57
PACON TRU-RAY #103038, PACON PEACOCK #P8012
CONSTRUCTION PAPER - GRAY 12 X 18 $4.29 $4.57
PACON TRU-RAY #103059, PACON PEACOCK #P8812
CONSTRUCTION PAPER - FESTIVE RED (HOLIDAY) 12 X 18 $4.29 $4.57
PACON TRU-RAY #103432, PACON PEACOCK #P9912
CONSTRUCTION PAPER - SKY BLUE 12 X 18 $4.59 $4.57

PACON TRU-RAY #103048, PACON PEACOCK #P7612

Domtar

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

School

Specialty

No Bid

$145.43/4

$36.36/each

$118.61

$4.10

$4.10

$4.10

$4.10

$4.10

$4.10

S&S

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Veritiv

No Bid

No Bid

$69.95

$2.98

$3.75

$3.70

$3.60

$3.80

$3.65

WCP

Solutions

$17.73

No Bid

$66.45

$2.73

$3.41

$3.61

$3.00

$3.15

$2.95



Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #100-20 Recap - Paper

Award is in bold

* = Alternate

#021140

#021143

#021158

#021162

#021165

#021168

#021169

#021173

#021174
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Arctic Office Cascade School

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - PINK 12 X 18 $4.10
PACON TRU-RAY #103044, PACON PEACOCK #P7012

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - WHITE 12 X 18 $4.29
PACON TRU-RAY #103058, PACON PEACOCK #P8712

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - DARK BROWN 9 X 12 $2.18
PACON TRU-RAY #103024, PACON PEACOCK #P6809

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - SKY BLUE 9 X 12 $2.11
PACON TRU-RAY #3016, PACON PEACOCK #P7609

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - PINK9 X 12 $2.17
PACON TRU-RAY #3012, PACON PEACOCK #P7009

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - WHITE 9 X 12 $2.17
PACON TRU-RAY #103026, PACON PEACOCK #P8709

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - YELLOW 9 X 12 $2.17
PACON TRU-RAY #103004, PACON PEACOCK #P8409

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - ROYAL BLUE9 X 12 $2.17
PACON TRU-RAY #103017, PACON PEACOCK #P7309

CONSTRUCTION PAPER - LIGHT GREEN 9 X 12 $2.13 Alt
PACON SUNWORKS #P8103

Supplies

$4.57

$4.57

$2.31

$2.31

$2.31

$2.31

$2.31

$2.31

$2.31 Alt

Domtar

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

School

Specialty

$4.10

$4.10

$2.30

$2.30

$2.30

$2.30

$2.30

$1.78 Alt

$1.78

S&S

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Veritiv

$3.48

$2.90

$1.85

$1.73

$1.89

$1.77

$2.15

$2.20

$1.45

WCP

Solutions

$3.17

$2.69

$1.61

$1.52

$1.66

$1.40

$1.60

$1.71

$1.71



Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #100-20 Recap - Paper

Award is in bold

* = Alternate

#021182

#021185

#021186

#021187

#021188

#021189

#021190

#021191

#021196
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COPY PAPER - SALMON 8.5X 11
XEROX #3R11058

COPY PAPER - BUFF 8.5" X 11
XEROX #3R11054, DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE #81204

COPY PAPER - BLUE 8.5 X 11
XEROX VITALITY #3R11050, HAMMERMILL #10330-9

COPY PAPER - GREEN 8.5 X 11
XEROX #3R11051, DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE #81197

COPY PAPER - PINK 8.5 X 11
XEROX VITALITY #3R11052, HAMMERMILL #10338-2,
CASCADE #BCPMP2201PK

COPY PAPER - YELLOW 8.5 X 11
XEROX VITALITY #3R11053, HAMMERMILL #10334-1

COPY PAPER - GOLDENROD 8.5X 11
XEROX #3R11055, HAMMERMILL #10316-8

COPY PAPER - WHITE 8.5 X 11
XEROX VITALITY #3R2047 only

COPY PAPER - WHITE 8.5 X 14
XEROX VITALITY #3R3761, HAMMERMILL TIDAL #162016

Arctic Office Cascade School

$59.40 Alt

$59.40 Alt

$54.00

$54.00

$54.00

$54.00

$54.00

$49.50

$55.50 Alt

Supplies

No Bid

$64.93 Alt

$64.93 Alt

$64.93 Alt

$64.93 Alt

$6.49 Alt

$6.49 Alt

No Bid

$90.30 Alt

Domtar

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

School

Specialty

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

S&S

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Veritiv

$59.35 Alt

$59.35 Alt

$59.35

$59.35 Alt

$59.25

$59.25

$59.25

$39.95 Alt

$56.90 Alt

WCP

Solutions

$56.70 Alt

$56.70

$56.70 Alt

$56.70

$56.70 Alt

$56.70 Alt

$56.70 Alt

$46.00

$54.96



Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #100-20 Recap - Paper

Award is in bold

* = Alternate

#021197

#021198

#021325

#021350

#021360
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COPY PAPER - WHITE 8.5 X 11 (3-HOLE PUNCHED)
XEROX VITALITY #3R2641

COPY PAPER - WHITE 11 X 17
XEROX VITALITY #3R3761, HAMMERMILL TIDAL #162024

NOTEBOOK FILLER PAPER 8.5 X 11 pkg of 200
APC #140P200, SCHOOL SMART #085289, SPARCO #SPR82120

PAD, STENOGRAPHER’S 6 X 9 - 80/sht/each
STAPLES #163485, SCHOOL SMART #085290

PAD, LEGAL 8.5 X 11 YELLOW
AMPAD #20-420, STAPLES #163840, TOPS #7532,
SCHOOL SMART #027430

Arctic Office Cascade School

$51.50

$52.50

$3.54

$2.34 Alt

$0.98

Supplies

No Bid

$61.25

$2.26 Alt

Not equal

$.95 Alt

$.96 Alt

Domtar

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

School

Specialty

No Bid

No Bid

$2.93

$1.96

$1.08

S&S

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Veritiv

$46.90 Alt

$44.90 Alt

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

WCP

Solutions

$44.10

$50.50

$2.44 Alt

No Bid

No Bid



