Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
RFP #101-20: E-Rate Telecommunications Services and Equipment
Bid Re-Cap, Posted 2/6/2020

Red cell indicates bid award

_ Service ACS GCI SPITwSPOTS TelAlaska Structured
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Ninilchik School $ 550.00| NoBid |$ 1,626.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Homer High |'$ 825.00] NoBid |$ 4,945.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Kenai Central |'$ 825.00] NoBid |$ 4,945.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Soldotna High |$ 825.00] NoBid |$ 4,945.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Kenai Middle | $ 825.00] NoBid |$ 4,945.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Skyview Middle | $ 825.00] NoBid |$ 4,945.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Homer Middle | $ 825.00] NoBid |$ 4,945.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Chapman | $ 550.00] NoBid |$ 1,626.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Tustumena |$ 550.00] NoBid |$ 1,626.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Redoubt | $ 550.00] NoBid |$ 1,626.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - West Homer |'$ 550.00] NoBid |$ 1,626.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Mountain View | $ 550.00] NoBid |$ 1,626.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Kaleidoscope |'$ 550.00] NoBid |$ 1,626.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 1.1: Data (Fiber) - Hub Aggregation |'$ 2,225.00] NoBid |$  10,900.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - '-I'ebughna | No Bid | $3,768.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - Susan B. English |'$ 355.00] No Bid $ 180.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - Nikiski High |'$ 550.00 ] No Bid 1,405.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - Seward Area |'$ 5,994.00 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - Marathon | 17.50/Mb | NoBid No Bid 18.00/Mb No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - Paul Banks | 550 + 340,000 NRC | $1,000.00 | $ 139.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - Hope |$ 250.00 ] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - Moose Pass | No Bid | NoBid No Bid 301.07 + 845 NRC No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - Sterling |$ 550.00 | No Bid $ 1,907.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - K-Beach |$ 550.00 ] No Bid $ 694.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - Nikiski North Star | § 550.00] NoBid |$ 1,050.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - Homer Flex | 550 + 141,000 NRC | $1,000.00 | $ 139.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - Kenai Alternative | 550 + 141,000 NRC | $1,000.00 | $ 873.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 2: Data (Managed) - Hub Aggregation | § 2,225.00 | $1,740.00 $ 353.76 No Bid
Part 1.2: Fiber IRU (Various Sites) | No Bid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Part 1.3: IRU Optics/Equipment (Switch) | No Bid | NoBid No Bid No Bid $ 7,756.06
Part 1.3: IRU Optics/Equipment (Optics) | No Bid | NoBid No Bid No Bid 66.67 - 387.78
Part 3: Internet - Districtwide |'$ 3,750.00] NoBid |$ 11,639.00 No Bid No Bid
Part 4: Seward Sign | No Bid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid

*k

No Award*
No Award*

* Per RFP: (Part 1.3) will be awarded contingent upon an award of dark fiber IRUs in Part 1.2. If no solution is awarded in Part 1.2, no equipment/optics
will be awarded in Part 1.3

** One hub aggregation link is required per service provider



